Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (622/2024/40 Fin) - Rehabilitation & Construction of Saint Stanislaus School

. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. & Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Khemraj Nauth Inc $ 273,170,501] $ 7,506,000 Assuria v 0
2 |Sheriff Construction Inc 3 315,216,037 v 2
China Jiangsu International Corporation
3 Trinidad & Tobago Ltd 3 201,351,887 v 0
File Number: Guyana Revenue Authority (124/2024/03) - Supply & Delivery of Motor Vehicles (New)
1 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd L1 $ 8,000,000 $ 976,000 CG United v v v 1
1 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd L2 $ 40,800,000
2 |Beharry Automative Ltd L1 3 12,500,000 $ 426,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Beharry Automative Ltd L2 $ 8,800,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (333/2024/46) - Procurement of Works for the Construction of Campbellville Health Center

. . . Form of
Bﬁgler Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Se%’;:r%nAcryoum & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :fgnnizr CHc?;S Elr?\s;z
1 |PP Building Contracting $ 637,600,200 | $ 6,376,002 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Construct It Inc $ 1,058,949,890 | $ 10,589,499 Nafico v v v 2
Assuria (Form of
3 |Pivot Engineering Inc $ 7,377,071 Tender Page Not v X X 2
Completed & Signed
4 |Avinash Contracting & Scrap Metal Inc $ 988,273,640 | $ 9,882,737 Premier v v v 2
5 |Qingjian Group Company Guyana Inc $ 1,167,793,956 | $ 7,760,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 857 756,052 | $ 8.577 561 Caricom v v v 5
General Supplies Inc
7 |Cloud Construction $ 727,234,000 | $ 7,662,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |AM Concepts Inc $ 610,388,640 | $ 6,103,386 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Blue Print Builders Inc $ 733,830,000 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Kares Engineering Inc $ 776,270,400 | $ 7,765,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |[Sheriff Construction $ 712,662,500 | $ 7,850,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 798,015,000 | $ 7,200,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Onyx Engineering Inc $ 751,358,800 | $ 7,662,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 829,811,890 | $ 8,205,100 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate (4 Storey Single Lot) $ 865,313,013
Engineer's Estimate (2 Storey Double Lot) $ 766,197,840




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Guyana Power & Light (315/2024/02) - Supply & Delivery of Line Hardware

. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh

No. & Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 110,066,000 [ $ 10,800,000 Assuria v v v 2
1 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 30,653,500
2 |Fixit Depot L1 $ 924,500.00 USD|$ 85,000 USD Caricom v v v 2
2 |Fixit Depot L2 $ 358,924.50 USD
2 |Fixit Depot L3 $ 2,855,600.00 USD
3 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 123,322,400 | $ 11,630,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 49,760,600
3 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 408,326,100




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Guyana Power & Light (316/2024/02) - Supply & Delivery of 15KV Medium Voltage Cables & 600VAC Control Cables

. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Tels Engineering Services $ 412,125,000 $ 9,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Aronco Services Inc $ 2,140,962.50 USD| $42,818.65 USD Premier v v v 2
3 |Fixit Depot $ 1,254,092.00 USD| $28,000.00 USD Caricom v v v 2
4 |Excel Guyana Inc $ 18,726,598 Premier (No Form of v v X 1 2
Tender Page Seen)
5 |>Jagmohan Construction & General | ¢ 1,061,000,0000 $ 21,300,000 Premier Vv | v 2
Supplies Inc
6 |SPR Enterprises $ 911,550,000 $ 8,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Cummings Electrical Company Ltd $ 1,156,000.00USD | $ 6,000,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Health (340/2024/47) - Construction of Simulation Centers Lots 1-3

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA | NiIs Tender Hard Fla_lsh

No. Currency & Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |BM Property Investments Inc L1 $ 156,432,850 | $ 3,128,657 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L1 $ 114,409,560 | $ 7,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L2 $ 171085410 | $ 7,000,000
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L3 $ 7,000,000
3 |DBL Group Inc L1 $ 86,272,185 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
4 |Dundas Constuction Inc L1 $ 99,035,650 | $ 2,040,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |KNS Peetum Construction L1 $ 105,725,770 | $ 2,220,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 149,249,100 | $ 6,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 270,606,000 | $ 6,000,000

7 |Amy's Enterprise L1 $ 03,828,019 | $ 1,876,560 Premier v v v 2
7 |Amy's Enterprise L3 $ 153,549,127 | $ 3,072,995

8 |MAEC Enterprises L1 $ 142,862,050 | $ 4,384,670 Assuria v v v 2
8 |MAEC Enterprises L3 $ 219,233,500 | $ 2,857,241




Caricom (Form of Tender

9 |Gryphon Engineering Inc $ 3,400,000 Not Completed &
Signed)
10 |AM Concepts Inc L1 $ 90,181,200 | $ 1,803,624 Caricom
10 |AM Concepts Inc L2 $ 140,847,710 | $ 2,816,954
10 |AM Concepts Inc L3 $ 145,590,610 | $ 2,911,812
Caricom (Form of Tender
11 |S&S Engineering $ 1,545,725 Not Completed &
Signed)
12 Dlglta_l Design, Construction, Logistics & $ 92573595 | $ 1851471 Caricom
Supplies L1
12 Dlglta_l Design, Construction, Logistics & $ 155299754 | $ 3,105,995
Supplies L2
12 Dlglta_l Design, Construction, Logistics & $ 146394761 | $ 2927894
Supplies L3
13 |Kumar Narine Construction Services L1 $ 163,319,080 | $ 3,263,471 Premier
14 |Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 147,377,701 | $ 3,000,000 Assuria
14 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 148,367,400 | $ 3,000,000
14 |Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 167,443,871 | $ 3,000,000
15 [Westbrook Caribbean Inc L1 $ 87,597,994 | $ 2,512,400 Caricom
16 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 149,891,921 | $ 3,200,000 Assuria




16 |[Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 150,367,440 | $ 3,200,000
16 |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 144111870 | $ 3,200,000
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 101,374,450
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 171,170,550
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 161,687,715

File Number: Ministry of Health (324/2024/47) - Supply, Delivery & Commissioning of One Generator

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla_lsh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 9,778,263 $ 195,565 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Bureau of Statistics (133/2024/03) - Rehabilitation of Guard Hut & Repairs to Southern Chainlink Fence

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & il\?nizﬁrgy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS lfl'c;;rgeorf Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
Bid Security Declaration
1 [JJ Strategic Services $ 4,523,240 Page Completed & v v v 0
Signed
Bid Security Declaration
2 |Baroque Engineering & Construction Services $ 4,890,644 Page Completed & v v v 1
Signed
3 Sovereigqty Investments Construction Services $ 4,846,765 B'dpisguégzqzeezzrgon Y v v 1
(SICS Builders) :
Signed
4 |Modern Elevations $ 6,308,840| $ 126,177 Assuria v v v 1
5 |R&J Construction $ 419,140 Form of Tender Pa\_ge Not v v v 1
Completed but Signed
5 |R&J Construction $ 619,468
Bid Security Declaration
6 |Ajan Construction & Services $ 5,233,014 Page Completed & v v v 1
Signed
7 |Fort's Engineering $ 6,782,919 | $ 135,658 Premier v v v 1
8 |Gilpin Enterprise $ 5,227,805 | $ 104,557 Assuria v | v v 1
Bid Security Declaration
9 |MAEC Enterprises $ 5,606,425 Page Completed & v v v 2
Signed
10 ([Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $ 5,330,083 | $ 120,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |HKDL Construction Inc $ 6,925,798 | $ 138,516 Assuria v v v 1




Bid Security Declaration

12 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 5,047,790 Page Completed &
Signed
Assuria (Bid Security
13 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 4,904,048 | $ 98,081 Declaration Page
Completed & Signed)
14 |C Roberts Construction Inc $ 5,585,030 | $ 111,700 Assuria
Assuria (Bid Security
15 |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 4,385,380 | $ 87,710 Declaration Page
Completed & Signed)
Bid Security Declaration
16 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 5,124,240 Page Completed &
Signed
Bid Security Declaration
17 |K Ramdial Construction & Services $ 4,602,070 Page Completed &
Signed
Bid Security Declaration
18 [RD Construction Consultancy & General Services $ 6,817,810 Page Completed &
Signed
Bid Security Declaration
19 |Construct It Inc $ 6,028,990 Page Completed &
Signed
Engineer's Estimate - Guard Hut $ 3,312,540
Engineer's Estimate - Chain Link Fence $ 2,351,800




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (377/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Oil Lubricants & Greases

Form of

Bidder . . Bid Security Amount . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency & Currency Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS 'Sr;nnoézr Copy | drive
1 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd $ 267,022,341 $ 5,340,447 CG United v v v 1
2 |Farm Supplies Ltd $ 143,847,240 $ 2,825,345 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Tarran Trading Enterprise $ 175,428,700| $ 3,508,574 Premier v v v 1 2
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (378/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Two Fertilizer Applicator
. . . Form of
Bidder . . Bid Security Amount . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency & Currency Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'Sl'iznntiedr Copy | drive
1 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 4,200,000( $ 840,000 Assuria v v v 2
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (379/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Double Wheel Rotary Drain Ditchers
. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd $ 11,749,024 $ 234,980 Assuria v v v 2
2 |General Marine Company $ 17,488,813| $ 360,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Game Equipment LLC $66,830.00 USD $1635.60 USD| Synergy Bank N/A | N/A v 2
4 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd $ 13,950,000f $ 279,000 CG United v v v 2
5 |WET Solutions, LLC $56,632.72 USD|  $1132.65 USD P('gﬁesjg)k NANA| v | 1] 0
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (380/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of One Mobile Welding Plant
. . . Form of
Bidder . . Bid Security Amount . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency & Currency Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS 'Sriegnntizr Copy| drive
1 |Garnet Engineers $27.888 USD|  $557,076 usp| RovalBankof Al v Lo | 1

Canada (Cheque)




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (387/2024/51) - Construction of Administrative Building at Lusignan Prison

Form of

Bﬁg.er Name of Bidder BlguArT;:cr; & Bid Ze%tlrténAcr;mum Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS 'Sl'iegnntizr 'C;I;;S ';L?\S/Z
1 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 179,534,649 | $ 2,693,020 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 194,526,833 | $ 2,925,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Advance Engineering $ 167,136,420 | $ 2,700,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 |AA Construction $ 165,984,252 | $ 2,489,764 Premier v v v 2
5 |Premier Contracting Services $ 161,827,176 | $ 2,427,408 Premier v v v 2
6 |KP Engineering $ 171,186,750 | $ 2,715,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 172,369,638 | $ 2,585,545 Premier v v v 2
8 |Modern Construction & Trucking Service $ 171,848,736 | $ 2,662,528 Assuria v v v 2
9 |F. Tappin Construction, Plumbing & Supply Service $ 179,825,890 | $ 2,697,389 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Navin & Sons Construction $ 184,581,264 | $ 2,795,515 Assuria v v v 2
11 |BM Property Investments Ltd $ 241,565,258 | $ 3,623,479 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 149,077,950 | $ 2,236,169 Assuria v v v 2
13 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 223,692,263 | $ 3,355,383 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Singh & Son Construction $ 213,807,615 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v X v 2

Premier (Form of Tender
15 |Rockey & Son Construction $ 2,829,431 | Page Not Completed & | v v X 2
Signed)
16 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 173,098,419.90 | $ 3,979,800 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 176,252,291




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (388/2024/51) - Construction of Kitchen at Phase 11 Prison Mazaruni

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & i&iﬁ%ﬁrg Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS lfl'ci;rgeorf Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 81,679,763 |$ 1,854,600 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 63,045,728 |$ 1,300,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Royal Real Estate & Construction $ 66,466,103 |$ 1,329,322 Premier v v v 2
4 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 51,909,270 | $ 935,285 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Service $ 75969470 |$ 1,499,390 Caricom v v v 2

No Bid Security Seen (Form
6 |J. Ajuda Construction of Tender Page Not v v X 2
Completed & Signed)
7 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 58,256,678 | $ 5,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Metal & Fabication Ink $ 79,409,295 | $ 1,588,186 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 89,201,116




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (389/2024/51) - Construction of Bridge at Mahaica Police Station

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & iﬁiiﬁ:gy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Ifrc;;n;eorf Hard FlfflSh

No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
No Bid Security Seen

1 |J. Ajuda Construction (Form of Tender Page Not | v v X 2
Completed & Signed)

2 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 19,674,060 | $ 393,481 Caricom v v v 2

3 |Panteon Construction Inc $ 27,055,655 | $ 405,385 Premier v v v 2

4 |Royal Real Estate & Construction $ 37,585,065 | $ 751,701 Premier v v v 2

5 |Energy Empire $ 14,169,986 | $ 365,865 Caricom v v v 2

- Bid Security Declaration

6 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 13,025,523 Page Completed & Signed v v v 2

7 ;?J\;I%r:rlg)nty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 12.728.888 | 254578 Assuria v v v 2

8 |Singh & Son Construction $ 17,479,980 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2

9 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 14,358,960 | $ 288,000 Assuria v v v 2

10 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 21,564,953 | $ 431,291 Caricom v v v 2
Assuria (Bid Security

11 |H&S Contracting Services $ 10,983,252 | $ 164,749 Declaration Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed)

12 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 18,787,388 | $ 375,548 Assuria v v v 2

13 |AA Construction $ 29,636,618 | $ 592,723 Premier v v v 2

Premier (Form of Tender
14 [NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 272,039 | Page Not Completed & v v v 2
Signed)

15 |Alliance Construction & General Supplies $ 18,821,040 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2

16 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 16,563,960 | $ 340,000 Assuria v v v 2

17 [Modern Construction & Trucking Services $ 11,823,462 | $ 177,352 Assuria v v v 2




18 [Dundas Construction Inc $ 16,971,465 | $ 320,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Extermax Pest Control $ 11,658,140 | $ 174,872 Assuria v v v 2
20 |Rockey & Son Construction $ 22,552,500 | $ 425,050 Premier v v v 2
21 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 14,456,610 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Six S General Construction $ 15,378,038 | $ 242,188 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Engineered Construction Company $ 16,145,850 | $ 242,188 Caricom v v v 2
. : : : Bid Security Declaration
24 |F. Tappin Construction, Plumbing & Supply Service $ 16,945,184 Page Completed & Signed v v v 2
25 |Premier Contracting Services $ 26,952,812 | $ 539,056 Premier v v v 2
: : Bid Security Declaration
26 |[Teon Peters Construction Service $ 14,275,548 page Completed & Signed v v v 2
o . Bid Security Declaration
27 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 15,506,715 Page Completed & Signed v v v 2
. : : Bid Security Declaration
28 [Romain Construction, General Services & Supply $ 15,716,736 page Completed & Signed v v v 2
Caricom (Form of Tender
29 |Lenel Enterprise $ 380,164 | Page Not Completed & v v X 2
Signed)
Engineer's Estimate $ 13,958,700




Date of Tender Opening: October 22, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (390/2024/51) - Construction of Concrete Bridge at Police Headquarters

Form of

B.ng.er Name of Bidder B'gﬁrr?::cl;t & Bid zeggltéavount Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS 'Is';nncie(zjr chr:S EL?\S;Z
1 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 17,039,400 | $ 340,788 Caricom v v v 2
2 [Singh & Son Construction $ 26,130,825 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |Rockey & Son Construction $ 32,985,800 | $ 659,716 Premier v v v 2
4 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 17,383,800 | $ 364,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 18,152,400 | $ 348,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 18,905,250 | $ 460,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Alliance Construction & General Supplies $ 25,294,815 | $ 430,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Energy Empire $ 18,528,038 | $ 365,864 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Phoenix Engineering & Consultancy Inc $ 17,796,450 | $ 400,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |H&S Contracting Services $ 18,820,725 | $ 253,961 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Extermax Pest Control $ 17,439,450 | $ 243,842 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Officepro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 17,834,565 | $ 356,691 Assuria v v v 2

Caricom (Form of Tender
13 |Lenel Enterprise $ 558,780 Page Not Completed & v v X 2
Signed)
14 |AA Construction $ 37,577,400 | $ 751,548 Premier v v v 2
15 [Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 23,759,400 | $ 475,180 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Premier Contracting Services $ 36,978,900 | $ 739,578 Premier v v v 2
17 |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 18,482,100 | $ 369,642 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Engineered Construction Company $ 16,834,655 | $ 252,520 Caricom v v v 2
19 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 25,937,100 | $ 460,986 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Pantheon Construction Inc $ 38,236,485 | $ 573,547 Premier v v v 2
21 |Romain Construction, General Services & Supply $ 19,616,100 | $ 294,242 Premier v v v 2
22 |Royal Real Estate & Construction $ 44,047,500 | $ 838,719 Premier v v v 2
23 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 16,814,700 | $ 252,244 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Six S General Construction $ 17,092,955 | $ 252,520 Caricom v v v 2




25 [Dundas Construction Inc $ 15,663,375 | $ 240,000 Caricom v v v
26 [Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 18,750,375 | $ 375,007 Caricom v v v
No Bid Security Seen (Form of
27 |J. Ajuda Construction Tender Page Not Completed &| v v X
Signed)
28 ;?J\{Izr:rlg)nty Investments Construction Services (SICS 10.944.225 398 885 Assuria v v v
29 |NP Contracting & Tranportation Services $ 17,926,650 | $ 268,900 Premier v v v
30 [Modern Construction & Trucking Service $ 18,219,600 | $ 273,937 Assuria v v v
Engineer's Estimate $ 18,293,100




