Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Natural Resources (35/2024/26) - Provision of Marketing Services for the Cooperative Republic of Guyana's Oil Entitlement from Lot 1-Liza Destiny FPSO Vessel, Lot 2-Liza
Unity FPSO Vessel, Lot 3-Payara Prosperity FPSO Vessel, Lot 4-Any two (2) Lots combined and Lot 5-Combined Lots 1, 2 and 3

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & 'i?niﬁf]‘:igy Bidsecurity | _on | i FTz;md:: Hard | coo

No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy

1 |Equinor (Norway) 14
2 |Trafigura Pte Ltd (Singapore) 0
3 |Oando PLC (Nigeria) 1 2
4 |Mercuria Energy Trading S.A (Switzerland) 1 2
5 |BP Oil International Limited (UK) 1 2
6 |EK Holdings Limited (London) 1 4
7 |ExxonMobil Sales & Supply LLC (USA) 1 2
8 [Petraco Oil Company Limited (Guernsey) 10
9 [Shell Western Supply & Trading Limited (Bahamas) 1
10 |Adnoc Trading Ltd (UAE) 1 4
11 |TOTSA TotalEnergies Trading SA (Switzerland) 1
12 |Chevron Products Company (USA) 1 0
13 |BB Energy Trading Limited (London) 1 2
14 |Cathay Petroleum International Limited (Hong Kong) 1 6
15 |Apioil Oil UK Limited (London) 1 2
16 |Gunvor SA (Switzerland) 1 10
17 |Glencore Energy UK Limited (London) 1 2
18 |Vitol SA (Switzerland) 1 2
19 [SOCAR Trading SA (Switzerland) 1 2
20 |[Springfield Energy Limited (Switzerland) 1 2
21 |Bono Energy Limited (Nigeria) 1 8
22 |CNOOC Trading (Singapore) PTE Ltd (Singapore) 1 2
23 |ENI Trading & Shipping Inc (USA) 6
24 |Petro China International (America) Inc (USA) 1 2
25 |JE Energy Limited (London) 1 2
26 |Unipec America Inc (USA) 2
27 |Bono Energy Limited (Nigeria), Sispro Inc (Guyana) - JV 6




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (73/2024/39 Fin) - Consultancy Services for the Design & Supervision of New Care Centre for the Elderly at Enmore

: . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder B'gArTO#nt & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender (':_'Oard Flash drive
0. urrency Currency signed Py
1 Engineering & Agricultural Consultants $  24.491250 Inclusive of v 1
Inc. local taxes

2 |Phoenix Industries $ 9,802,000 Inclusive of v

local taxes 1
3 |Kalitech Inc $ 44,100,000 Inclusive of all v

taxes 0

6 |Orign Investments $ 22,750,000

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (74/2024/39 Fin) - Consultancy Services for the Design, Preparation of Bill of Quantities & Supervision of Electrical

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard .
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender Copy Flash drive
Currency signed
1 IIEnanlneermg & Agricultural Consultants $ 7 745,000 v .
4 |Orign Investments $ 4,900,000 v 0
5 |Kalitech Inc (Inclusive of all taxes) $ 6,100,000 v 0




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (207/2024/01) - Consultancy Services to Undertake Glint & Glare Study for proposed Solar PV Power Plant at Cheddi Jagan International Airport

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender |Hrd Flash drive
No. Currency Currency signed Copy
MEP Engineering Services Inc and CAEC Financial
1 [New Era Airport Design & Research Proposal Sub v v v 2 1
Institute Co. Ltd P
File Number: Ministry of Health (320/2024/47) - Supply & Delivery of Dental Supplies
. . Bid Security Form of
B'Sder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NI | Tender |Hrd Flash drive
0. Currency . Copy
Currency signed
1 [Meditron Inc. $ 115,653,955 $ 4,000,000 Diamond v v v 2
2 |New GPC Inc. $ 237,773,386| $ 4,800,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. $ 242,060,840] $ 4,841,217 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc. $ 174581,625 $ 3,491,633 Premier v v v 2
5 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. $ 111,339,214 $ 3,000,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Western Scientific Company Ltd. $1’211’03§'§ $ 11,550,000 Premier N/A | N/A Y 2
7 |Clever Solutions Guyana Inc (GUY Reg) /| ¢ 179 950 076| $ 3,700,000  Assuria Vi v ]| v 2

Clever Solutions Limited (Trini reg.)




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (76/2024/11) - Procurement of Election Bags

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ii?niﬁ%tigy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Ifl'(zernrglleorTc Hard | oy ash drive
No. Currency Currency signed Copy
No Bid Security Seen,
1 |Kreative Printing & Office Supplies $ 23,670,000 however BSD Completed| v v 2
& Signed
2 |Supergraphics $ 14,700,000 $ 147,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Hoyte's Logistics $ 15,000,000{ $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Raphael's Trading Enterprise $ 15,100,000 $ 151,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Ritecutz Enterprise $ 15,150,000 $ 151,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Alliance Investments $ 43,500,000 $ 435,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |KK Techcom Rentals & Suppliers $ 15,000,000 $ 150,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Webster's engineering & Consultancy $ 10,800,000{ $ 150,000 Assuria v v v 1
9 [Supreme Distributors $ 7,500,000 $ 75,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |[Projecevolve Inc $ 25,500,000 $ 255,000 GTM v v v 2
g1 |S&K Consultancy Services & General $ 4,800,000 $ 4,800,000 Caricom v | v | v 2
Supplies Inc




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (133/2024/31) - Construction of Access Road leading to Guyana National Control Center (GNCC) at Goedverwagting

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS T_ender Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |R&B Investment Inc $ 42,589,640( $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |SSS Professional Engineering Services Inc $ 39,211,053| $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Devcon Inc $ 52,443,487 $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |C&L Construction Inc $ 37,311,750 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $43,336,500
File Number: Environmental Protection Agency (208/2024/01) - Procurement of Microsoft Office 2021 and Microsoft Windows 11 Pro for th EPA
. . Bid Security Form of
BIISder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender | Hard Fla_lsh
0. Currency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 |ResConex Investment & Management Inc $ 4,000,000 $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 7,802,000 $ 156,040 Assuria v v v 2
. No Bid
3 |NCC Enterprise $ 2,835,000 Security Seen v v Y 1
4 |Talnet Solutions $ 4,494 450| $ 89,889 Assuria v v v 1
5 |U-Mobile Cellular Inc $ 9,531,426 $ 190,629 Nafico v v v 1
6 |[Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service $ 785,000| $ 15,700 Cégr(l);(;r)n v v v 1
7 |Zenith Services Inc $ 6,709,500 $ 160,000 Assuria v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-ASDU (359/2024/21) - Procurement of New Equipment Lot 1 - Aluminum Boats Lot 2 - Outboard Engines

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(\:rlr;??enntcjc Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS :iegnnciedr Copy | drive
, : Caricom /
1 ﬂr‘mszr;tz t(iaoen”ggviznitlr“"t'on & $ 2,550,000 $  140,000| AlternativeBid | v | Ltr | v 2
P $2,250,000
\ : Caricom /
1 ﬂgr‘gs%r;tz t?oennggvizniguc“on & $ 67152000 $  50,000| Alternative Bid v
i $6,515,200
2 |Alliance Investments L1 $ 8,827,156| $ 176,543 Premier v v v 2
2 |Alliance Investments L2 $ 9,486,307 $ 189,726 Premier
3 |Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 6,005,500 $ 261,310 | Assuria (L1-2) v v v 2
3 |Guybiz Establishment L2 $ 760,000
4 |General Marine Company L1 $ 6,357,302 | $ 140,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |General Marine Company L2 $ 4,570,000 | $ 112,000
5 |A&P Logistics & Transportation Service L1 $ 4,902,000| $ 86,000 Assuria v | Ltr v 1
6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L1 $ 7,475,000( $ 149,500 Premier v v v 2
6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L2 $ 5,718,000 $ 114,360




K&K Boat Building Construction & General

7 Supplies L1 $ 3,050,000 $ 61,000 Caricom
7 K&K_Boat Building Construction & General $ 6.698.000| $ 133.960
Supplies L2
8 |MS Trading L1 $ 4,995,000 $ 100,000 Premier
8 |MS Trading L2 $ 5,000,000| $ 100,000
9 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd L1 $ 5,000,000| $ 100,000 Assuria
9 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd L2 $ 5,139,536| $ 102,790
10 |Farm Supplies Ltd L1 $ 13,500,000 $ 368,400 | Assuria (L1-2)
10 [Farm Supplies Ltd L2 $ 4,920,000
11 [IMS Construction & Logistics Services L1 $ 5,150,000| $ 116,000 Caricom




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation Inc (353/2024/2) - Supply & Delivery of Mill Rollers

Form of
Bidder . . Bid Security Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Currency Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'sl'iegnntie(:jr Copy | drive
. : Royal Bank of
Garnett Engineers Professional Team
1 J $330,888 USD $6677.17USD| Canada |N/A |[N/A| v | 1| 0
(Canada)
(Cheque)
. City Bank
2 |Universal (USA) $341,568 USD $6832 USD (Cheque) N/A | N/A v 2
Sai Sidha Sugar Equipment & Engineerin :
3 Jar =quip JINEerng $235,200 USD| $ 1,680,000 Assuria | N/A [N/A| 2
Company (India)
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation Inc (360/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Round up Ultra
. . . Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | Hard FI‘?ISh
0. Currency signed Copy | drive
1 [Shop Modern Guyana $ 16,950,000 $ 350,000 Assuria v v v 1
File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (354/2024/21) - EOI-Consultancy Services for the Preparation of Designs, Bidding Documents & Construction Supervision &
Capacity Building Activates for Guyana Coastal Adaption & Resilience Projects
. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | Hard FI"fISh
No. Currency signed Copy | drive
Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service,
1 |Project Planning & Management Ltd, CDR 2
International v v v
2 |Royal Haskoning , SRKN'gineering v v v 2
3 |GR Engineering, Pini Group v v v 1 2




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (355/2024/21) - Construction of Revetment & Repairs to Tucburg Sluice, Fort Canje New Amsterdam

Bid Security

Form of

Bll:Ii(c)i.er Name of Bidder Blcé ﬁrT::Cr;t & Aénlj??enr:cic Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :iegnncliir CHO"’I‘OT ';'rf’l‘jz
1 |Apex Engineering $ 59,014,200 | $ 876,920 Caricom v v v 2
2 |RJ Engineering Solutions $ 41,620,950 |$ 1,060,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |C Sohan Construction Services $ 50,942,850 |$ 1,068,081 Premier v v v 2
4 |Sheriff Construction $ 39,882,150 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |A Alli Construction $ 45,068,100 | $ 109,362 Premier v v v 2
6 |Persaud Engineering & Hyrdraulics Services $ 47,639,550 | $ 876,920 Caricom v X v 2
7 |Blacks & Son Construction $ 52,987,200 | $ 1,086,081 Nafico v v v 2
8 |[Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 48,894,300 | $ 1,068,081 Premier v v v 2

Caricom (Form of
9 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 1,068,081 | Tender Not Completed | v X 2
& Signed)
10 |Yunas Civil & Building Construction Services $ 49,616,700 | $ 1,068,081 Caricom v v v 1
11 |Kascon Engineering Service $ 45,977,400 | $ 920,000 Premier v v v 1
12 |Saywak & Saywak Associated Services $ 44,034,900 | $ 880,698 Caricom v v v 2
13 [A&J Construction Services $ 47,605,950 | $ 1,068,081 Premier v v v 2
14 |Avionics Engineering Inc $ 35,886,900 | $ 760,000 Nafico v v v 2
15 [Dundas Construction Inc $ 83,897,100 | $ 1,068,081 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Sawa Investments Inc $ 52,959,900 | $ 1,059,198 Premier v v v 2
17 |Better Works Enterprise Inc $ 50,648,640 No Bid Security Seen | v v 1
18 |Ameer's Enterprises $ 53,202,240 No Bid Security Seen | v v 2
19 [Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 106,024,800 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 1 2
20 |Deo's Imperial Construction Inc $ 52,546,200 | $ 1,068,081 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Memorex Enterprise $ 52,411,590 | $ 1,050,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Associated Construction Services $ 76,147,050 | $ 1,522,941 Caricom v v v 2




23 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 45,446,100 | $ 908,922 Premier v v v 2
24 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works $ 53,098,500 | $ 1,062,000 Assuria v v v 2
25 |Alpha Construction Services $ 45,498,600 | $ 909,972 Premier v v v 2
26 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service $ 46,930,800 | $ 1,068,081 Caricom v v v 2
27 |AE&N General Contracting $ 48,272,700 | $ 1,068,081 Premier v v v 2
28 [Hoosain's Construction Company $ 49,354,200 | $ 987,084 Caricom v v v 2
29 |Daks Engineering Guyana $ 50,416,800 | $ 1,008,336 Caricom v v v 2
30 [Hansi Engineering $ 35,172,900 | $ 760,000 Nafico v v v 2
31 |[Extermax Pest Control $ 50,244,810 | $ 1,004,896 Assuria v v v 2
32 |H&S Contracting Services $ 48,801,900 | $ 976,038 Assuria v v v 1
33 |Modern Construction & Trucking Services $ 50,140,440 | $ 1,002,766 Assuria v v v 2
34 |Shariff's Business Enterprise $ 47,226,900 | $ 1,068,080 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 48,300,000 | $ 798,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Professional Engineering & Construction Service $ 50,656,200 | $ 1,013,124 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 53,404,050




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (356/2024/21) - Construction of Culvert at Good Hope North Residential Area

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁg,er Name of Bidder Blgfrrr;:’cr;t & %T?;Jenntcjc Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :iegnn(ledr cl;;r;j I;Ir?\slz
1 |Zubair Contracting $ 32,223,135 | $ 644,463 Premier v v v 2
2 |Phoenix Engineering & Consultancy Inc $ 41,893,320 | $ 837,866 Premier (Copy) v v v 2
3 |New Castle Enterprise $ 51,402,120 |$ 1,028,042 Premier v v v 2
4 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) $ 28,416,297 | $ 684,959 Premier (Copy) v v v 2
5 |[NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 30,211,503 | $ 604,330 Premier v v v 2
6 |B&N Construction Services Inc $ 32,820,743 | $ 684,959 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction $ 23,966,376 | $ 630,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc $ 33,246,045 | $ 684,958 Caricom v v v 2
9 |A Alli Construction $ 29,487,308 | $ 589,746 Premier v v v 2
10 |R Kissoon Contracting Service $ 47,261,970 | $ 960,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Daks Engineering Guyana $ 31,755,675 | $ 635,114 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 29,099,889 | $ 684,959 Premier (AE&N General v v v 2

Contracting)
13 |H&S Contracting Services $ 31,586,289 | $ 631,726 Assuria v v v 1
14 |STP Investments Inc $ 40,010,565 | $ 800,211 Premier v v v 2
15 |DS Construction Services & Supplies $ 31,316,880 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 33,892,163 | $ 684,958 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc $ 31,651,935 | $ 633,039 Nafico v v v 2
18 |FMC Construction & Services Inc $ 45,492,825 | $ 909,857 Premier (Copy) v v v 2
19 [B&J Civil Works $ 50,032,248 | $ 1,200,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 30,185,558 | $ 603,711 Premier v v v 2
21 |Compass Industrial Services $ 33,733,350 | $ 674,673 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 46,230,765 | $ 1,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
23 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works $ 33,760,346 | $ 676,000 Assuria v v v 2




24 |Raj Civil Engineering Construction $ 39,207,365 | $ 784,147 Diamond v v v 2
Premier (Rishal's
25 |AE&N General Contracting $ 28,946,127 | $ 684,959 Construction & v v v 2
Maintenance Service)
26 |Modern Construction & Trucking Service $ 30,724,323 | $ 614,486 Assuria v v v 2
27 |M Sukhai Contracting Services $ 31,983,578 | $ 640,000 Caricom v v v 2
28 |Extermax Pest Control $ 31,101,435.75 | $ 622,029 Assuria v v v 2
29 |K Ramdial Construction Services $ 29,760,727.05 | $ 684,959 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Saywak & Saywak Associated Services $ 37,754,895 | $ 755,098 Caricom v v v 2
31 |Centaur Investments Inc $ 34,134,765 | $ 708,588 Premier v v v 2
32 |Ameer's Enterprises $ 32,565,514 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
33 |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 35,371,014 | $ 900,000 Caricom v v v 2
34 |Better Works Enterprise Inc $ 32,839,296 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
35 |[Applied Services $ 39,830,721 No Bid Security Seen v | Ltr v 2
36 |NK Engineering Services $ 32,988,984 Premier v v v 2
37 |General Procurment & Construction Inc $ 47,860,386 | $ 684,959 Premier v v v 2
38 |JLEE Enterprise $ 33,870,138 | $ 677,403 Premier v v v 2
39 [HG Construction & Services Inc $ 32,547,165 | $ 655,971 Caricom v v v 2
40 |Khemraj Nauth Inc. $ 36,758,820 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
41 |Advanced Construction Solutions $ 32,238,833 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
42 |Blacks & Son Construction $ 42,084,525 | $ 684,959 Nafico v v v 2
43 |Guygen Inc. $ 34,139,406 | $ 682,788 Caricom v v v 2
44 |Singh's Construction Welding & Fabricating $ 30,786,788 | $ 684,958 Caricom v v v 2
45 [(Wazim & Sons Infrastructure Inc. $ 59,024,910 | $ 876,920 Caricom v v v 2
46 |C Persaud Construction & Supplies Services $ 32,798,588 | $ 655,971 Caricom v v v 2
47 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 44,019,465 | $ 821,950 Caricom v v v 2
48 |Sonic Investments $ 33,747,930 | $ 674,959 Premier v v v 2
49 [Johnson General Construction & Transportation Servicg $ 31,080,210 | $ 605,000 Caricom v v v 1
50 |Bashier & Son's Inc $ 31,298,190 | $ 684,959 Nafico v v v 2
51 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 29,736,315 | $ 684,959 Caricom v v v 1




52 |Tratel Construction & Towing Services $ 31,805,865 | $ 620,000 Caricom v v v 1

53 |Gopie Investments Inc. $ 33,963,342 | $ 339,634 Premier v v v 2

54 |Deo's Imperial Construction $ 34,046,985 | $ 684,958 Caricom v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 34,237,930




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (816/2024/40) - Construction of Kanesville Secondary

. . . Form of
B"Sder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard FI&.‘Sh
0. Currency signed Copy drive
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 77592.218| $ 1639774 Premier v v v 9
Block B
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 39763.122| $ 785 566
Block C
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 105,724.511| $ 1,573,334
Block E
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 111,923,879 | $ 1,622,433
Block F
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $103.453.896 | $ 1,048 465
Block J
2 |A Ograsein & Sons Block A $55,386,975 | $ 1,700,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |A Ograsein & Sons Block B $103,084,333 | $ 1,600,000
2 |A Ograsein & Sons Block E $121,397,220 | $ 1,875,000
2 |A Ograsein & Sons Block G $68,981,483 | $ 1,400,000
2 |A Ograsein & Sons Block F -1 $ 2,400,000
3 |JD's Construction Company $ 1,378,684,769 Premier v v v 2
3 |JD's Construction Company Block A $ 270,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block B $ 1,446,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block C $ 840,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block D $ 494,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block E $ 1,681,500
3 |JD's Construction Company Block F $ 1,695,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block G $ 1,048,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block H $ 582,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block | $ 160,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block J $ 1,962,000
3 |JD's Construction Company Block K $ 4,977,000
4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block A $132,600,000 | $ 1,378,684,769 Premier v v v 2




4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block A $132,600,000 | $ 1,378,684,769 Premier v v v 2
4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block C $34,125,800 | $ 1,378,684,769 Premier v v v 2
4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block D $43,710,000 | $ 208,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block E $105,100,000

4  |JK Enterprise Inc. Block F $107,560,000

4  |JK Enterprise Inc. Block G $44,425,000

4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block H $25,100,000

4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block | $7,000,000

4 |JK Enterprise Inc. Block J $92,110,400

4  |JK Enterprise Inc. Block k $325,820

5 |D&S Construction Block A $77,575,227 1515000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |D&S Construction Block E $138,511,590 | $ 2,205,000

5 |D&S Construction Block F $116,561,556

5 |D&S Construction Block K $77,776,020 | $ 15,515,000

. . Caricom (Form of
6 éfr:ér;o gzt;:ﬁggglcoifﬂtamy Services & Tender Signed But | v v v 2
Not Completed
S&K Construction Consultancy Services &
6 General Supplies Block D $61,885100 | $ 1,634,342
S&K Construction Consultancy Services &

6 General Supplies Block K $290,302,393 | $ 4,354,535

7  [Sherriff Construction $1,001,468,491 | $ 12,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |You Nailed It Construction Block A $135,000,000 | $ 208,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |You Nailed It Construction Block B $69,300,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block ¢ $34,000,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block d $46,700,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block E $409,001,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block F $110,000,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block G $49,400,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block H $26,100,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block | $8,200,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block J $95,100,000

8 |You Nailed It Construction Block K $328,800,000




Engineer's Estimate A

$59,396,121

Engineer's Estimate B $72,300,688
Engineer's Estimate C $41,923,948
Engineer's Estimate D $49,722,707
Engineer's Estimate E $112,140,315
Engineer's Estimate F $113,027,459
Engineer's Estimate G $59,485,946
Engineer's Estimate H $29,189,248
Engineer's Estimate | $8,022,174
Engineer's Estimate J $98,174,666
Engineer's Estimate K $47,897,627




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (156/2024/44) - Design & Supervision Services - Construction of An Art Gallery

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA NIS | Tender |Hard FI§Sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy drive
- BSD Completed & Signed /
1 |Ongin Investments Financial Proposal Submitted v v v !
. . BSD Completed & Signed /
2 |PME Consulting Engineers Inc. Financial Proposal Submitted v v v 0
Innovative Engineering Consultancy BSD Completed & Signed /
3 . . . ) v v v 2
Services Financial Proposal Submitted
4 |Kalitech Inc. Financial Proposal Submitted v v v 2
5 Consulting Engineers & Planners BSD Completed & Signed / v v v 1 1
Guyana Financial Proposal Submitted
6 [Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service BSD Completed & Signed / v v v 1

Financial Proposal Submitted




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (149/2024/44) - Procurement & Installation of Bucket Seats Lots 2&4

Form of
Bidder . . Bid Security Amount . . Hard Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency & Currency Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS :iegnnc‘laedr Copy drive
1 SRK Gen(_eral Mal_ntenzfmce Infrastructure $ 23.800.000| $ 476,000 Premier v v Y 1
Construction Engineering L2
1 SRK Gen(_eral Mal_ntengnce Infrastructure $ 23.800.000
Construction Engineering L4
2 |MS Investments L2 $ 21,000,000 $ 420,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |MS Investments L4 $ 20,000,000 $ 400,000
3 ILI\SS Construction & Logistics Services $ 24.995.000| $ 520,000 Caricom v v v 9
3 :_'\ZIS Construction & Logistics Services $ 24,995,000 $ 520000
4 |Energy Empire L2 $ 24,686,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Energy Empire L4 $ 23,686,000 $ 1,000,000
5 S&K Constructlo_n Consultancy Services $ 20,000,000 $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 5
& General Supplies L2
5 S&K Construction Consultancy Services $ 21,000,000 $ 420000

& General Supplies L4




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (148/2024/44) - Design & Build Proposal for Designs & Implementation of the Digitization of Record of The National Archives and the Creation
of an Accompanying Database and Website National Archives of Guyana

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA NIS | Tender Hard | £1ash drive
o Currency Currency signed Copy
. - BSD Completed & Signed /
1 |Innovation Factory Limited (T&T) Financial Proposal Submitted v v v 2
2 |Yellow Three Financial Proposal Submitted v Ltr v 2
3 |V75 Incorporated Financial Proposal Submitted v v 2
4 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc. Financial Proposal Submitted v v 1
5 |AlX Solutions Financial Proposal Submitted v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (150/2024/44) - Procurement of Sports Gare National Sports Commission Lots 1-4

Bidder . _ Bid Security . . Formof | jarg Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Currency Bid Security Agency GRA NIS -Is-%nncg Copy drive
I
Caricom (North Wall
1 |Leading Edge Sports L1 $ 9,487,579 $ 189,751 Construction & v v v 1 2
Engineering)
1 |Leading Edge Sports L2 $ 3,600,152| $ 72,003
1 |Leading Edge Sports L3 $ 7,692,632| $ 153,852
1 |Leading Edge Sports L4 $ 4,102,737 $ 82,054
1 |Leading Edge Sports L5 $ 13,622,368| $ 272,447
2 |MS Investments L1 $ 4,334,400) $ 4,334,400 Caricom v v v 1 2
2 |MS Investments L2 $ 339,120 $ 393,180
2 |MS Investments L3 $ 982,800/ $ 982,800
2 |MS Investments L4 $ 491,400 $ 491,400
2 |MS Investments L5 $ 2,677,500] $ 2,677,500
3 |NSA Enterprise L1 $ 9,828,000| $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |NSA Enterprise L2 $ 1,663,200
3 |NSA Enterprise L3 $ 8,064,000
3 |NSA Enterprise L4 $ 4,284,000
3 |NSA Enterprise L5 $ 8,662,500
4 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 4284000 $ 4284000 Caricom v v v 5
General Supplies Inc L1
4 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 378,000| $ 378,000
General Supplies Inc L2
4 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 987.840| $ 987,840
General Supplies Inc L3
4 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 493.920| $ 493.920
General Supplies Inc L4
4 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 26250000 $ 2,625,000
General Supplies Inc L5
5 |Alliance Investments L1 $ 3,528,000| $ 771,883 Premier v v v 2
5 |Alliance Investments L3 $ 771,600 (L1-5)




5 |Alliance Investments L4 $ 3,880,800
5 |Alliance Investments L5 $ 23,888,350
6 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L1 $ 6,894,720 No Bid Security Seen
6 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L2 $ 861,840
6 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L3 $ 6,894,720
6 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L4 $ 3,447,360
6 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L5 $ 4,788,000
7 |Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 12,096,000| $ 167,472 Assuria
7 |Guybiz Establishment L2 $ 1,209,600 (L1-5)
7 |Guybiz Establishment L3 $ 14,112,000
7 |Guybiz Establishment L4 $ 7,056,000
7 |Guybiz Establishment L5 $ 18,900,000
8 |Moore Enterprise L1 $ 6,804,000 No Bid Security Seen
8 |Moore Enterprise L2 $ 1,058,400
8 |Moore Enterprise L3 $ 4,536,000
8 |Moore Enterprise L4 $ 2,268,000
8 |Moore Enterprise L5 $ 4,987,500
Nafico (Form of Tender
9 |Kojac L1 $ 12,096,000| $ 78,621 Not Completed &

Signed)




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (151/2024/44) - Completion of Multi-purpose Hall Mabaruma

Form of

B',gg_er Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency | B¢ Secg:r?;ri?ount & Bid security Agency GRA | NIS -srfg”n‘izr g)i;gj Z:r?\s/:
1 |LS Contracting Service $ 57,905,144 $ 1,359,454 Caricom v Ltr v 2
2 |Impecable Construction & General Supplies $ 58,149,190 $ 1,308,942 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Radon Construction $ 81,332,064| $ 1,626,641 Assuria v v v 0
4 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. $ 65,177,310 $ 1,936,413 Caricom v v v 2
5 |K's Truckin & Construction Services $ 95,726,400| $ 1,308,942 Premier v v v 2
6 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 63,995,712| $ 1,100,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Truck Smart $ 98,330,386| $ 1,960,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Cons $ 128,957,650| $ 2,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 64,474,531 $ 1,300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |A Alli Construction $ 83,428,048| $ 1,668,561 Premier v v v 2
11 |Sherriff Construction Inc, $ 64,781,530 $ 1,308,942 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Momin & Sons Construction $ 59,451,612| $ 1,308,942 Caricom v v v 2
13 |KV Contracting Services $ 9,756,919 $ 1,815,138 Nafico v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 65,447,119




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (152/2024/44) - Completion of Multi-purpose Hall Mahadia

Form of

Blﬂgler Name of Bidder B'gﬁ'?;#cr;’t & Bid Zec(t;;:'téﬁcn;ount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 'Is'%nnciedr (;E:)r; ';I:\S/:
1 |Ragnauth General Enterprise $ 98,311,693| $ 1,624,104 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Z&H Investment Inc. $  109,304,213| $ 1,639,563 Caricom v X v 2
3 |Truck Smart $ 133,777,008 $ 1,995,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. $ 109,227,405| $ 1,655,693 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 109,505,130| $ 2,207,591 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports $ 212,895,900 $ 1,800,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Ceraturium $ 100,869,143| $ 1,513,037 Caricom v v v 2
8 |IKhan Contracting Service $ 104,750,100 $ 1,256,666 Assuria v v v 2
9 |LS Contracting Services $ 100,307,580| $ 2,006,151 Caricom v v v 2
10 [Mohamed's Escavating Construction Inc $ 101,282,685 $ 1,519,240 Nafico v v v 2
11 |[Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Services $ 107,612,315 $ 1,614,320 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Sherriff Construction Inc $ 97,891,080| $ 2,207,591 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Imcepable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 92,613,675 $ 1,655,693 Caricom v v v 2
14 |K&D Contracting Services $ 101,850,000 $ 1,527,750 Nafico v v v 2
15 [K's Trucking & Construction Services $ 101,220,525| $ 1,655,695 Premier v v v 2
16 [Blue Print Builders Inc $ 95,617,830 $ 2,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
17 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 96,142,830 $ 2,100,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |A Alli Construction $ 96,218,850 $ 1,443,283 Premier v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 110,379,570




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (153/2024/44) - Completion of Multi-purpose Hall Mabaruma

Bi'flider Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 'fl'oe;rzeorf Hard FIE.‘Sh
0. Currency signed Copy drive
1 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 138,745,950| $ 2,450,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |LS Contracting Services $ 142,132,725 $ 2,131,990 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Singh & Son Construction $ 148,089,795| $ 2,221,447 Caricom v v v 2
4 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. $ 145,024,320 $ 2,194,373 Caricom v v v 1
5 |ARK Trading $ 143,294,550| $ 2,149,418 Nafico v v v 2
6 [Money Tree Trading $ 133,852,218 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
7 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 128,249,520| $ 2,925,783 Caricom v v v 2
8 [Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc $ 144,124,050| $ 2,161,861 Nafico v v v 2
9 |Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 118,001,100 $ 2,194,337 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Radcon Construction $ 144,942 945| $ 2,174,144 Assuria v v v 0
11 |Z&H Investment Inc. $ 145,237,690 $ 2,170,879 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Ceraturium $ 140,046,920 $ 2,115,628 Caricom v v v 2
13 |K's Trucking Construction & Transportation Service $ 150,698,100 $ 2,194,337 Premier v v v 2
14 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphic Services $ 144,700,500 $ 2,170,507 Assuria v v v 2
15 |[Sherriff Construction $ 139,986,294| $ 2,925,783 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Truck Smart $ 191,863,612 $ 2,865,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Tripple A General Contracting Services $ 122,851,575 $ 1,842,774 Premier v v v 2
18 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 151,414,975 $ 2,280,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc. $ 137,981,399| $ 280,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 |FS Construction $ 193,226,325 $ 2,087,056 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 146,289,150




Date of Tender Opening: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (154/2024/44) - Completion of Multi-purpose Hall Lethem

. . . . . Form of
B'ﬂg'er Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency | B'° (ngcgl:'rtéﬁcr;w“m B"j_\zsrc]‘é;'ty GRA | NIS Z%nncizr g'oapr;’ ';'r"’l‘f/z
1 |[Ceraturium $ 57,379,350 $ 1,147,587 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Momin & Sons Construction $ 58,380,525| $ 1,397,615| Caricom v v v 2
3 |K's Trucking & Construction Service $ 64,041,600| $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphic Service $ 64,509,585| $ 1,290,192 Assuria v v v 1
5 |lkhan Contracting Ser $ 62,733,300| $ 1,571,252 Assuria v v v 2
6 [Sherriff Construction Inc $ 60,493,545| $ 1,397,615 Assuria v v v 2
7 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service 3 74,084,425| $ 1,500,000/ Caricom v v v 2
8 |JK Enterprise Enterprise Inc $ 57,109,500| $ 1,200,000| Caricom v v v 2
9 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 57,729,945| $ 1,200,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Truck Smart $ 101,549,805| $ 2,020,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Tripple A General Contracting Services $ 59,515,260| $ 1,190,305 Premier v v v 2
12 |[Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 52,339,875| $ 1,376,615| Caricom v v v 2
13 |Builders Engineering & Arc Consultancy $ 61,662,195| $ 1,233,244 Assuria v v v 2
14 |{Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 58,370,445| $ 1,300,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |FS Construction $ 62,591,025| $ 1,247,620/  Caricom v v v 2
16 |Radon Construction $ 62,850,900| $ 1,257,018 Assuria v v v 2
17 |LS Contracting Services $ 61,710,075| $ 1,234,201| Caricom v v v 2
18 |[Construct It Inc $ 69,181,350| $ 1,383,627 Nafico v v v 2
19 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 68,739,300 $ 1,397,615| Caricom v v v 2
20 [Mohameds Escavating Construction Inc $ 61,712,490| $ 1,234,250 Nafico v v v 2
21 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc $ 65,588,670| $ 1,397,615 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Panco Steel Fabrication & Costruction $ 64,628,445| $ 1,397,616 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 69,880,766




Date of Tender OpeniA1:J18ng: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (155/2024/44) - Completion of Multi-purpose Hall Leonora

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency i?niﬁ%lirgy Bid Security Agency GRA NIS El'c;;n;ec:‘f Hard Fla.‘Sh
No. Currency signed Copy drive
1 |Tripple A General Contracting Services $ 83,428,048| $ 1,668,561 Premier v v v 2
2 |Ezeway Construction Inc $ 77,014,487| $ 1,563,940 Caricom v v v 2
3 |LS Contracting Services $ 61,753,983| $ 1,369,776 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Angad Building & General Construction $ 120,957,650] $ 1,290,192 Caricom v v v 2
5 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc $ 70,497,240| $ 1,412,546 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Money Tree Trading $ 96,559,980| $ 1,412,547 Premier v v v 2
7 |MK Enterprise $ 65,686,240| $ 1,412,546 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Lallchands Construction & Graphic Services $ 66,329,648| $ 1,200,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
9 |K's Trucking & Construction Services $ 124,915,450] $ 1,412,547 Premier v v v 2
10 [Sherriff Construction Inc $ 66,388,806| $ 1,412,546 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Truck Smart $ 92,314,310] $ 1,840,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |F&A Mohamed Firm $ 61,847,940| $ 1,412,546 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 64,942,860| $ 1,412,546 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 66,388,806| $ 1,400,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |MK Hanif Construction Service $ 70,161,050] $ 1,412,546 Caricom v v v 2
16 |BM Property Investment Inc $ 03,479,100] $ 1,624,429 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Qingjian Group Company Guyana Inc. $ 91,821,709| $ 1,412,546 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 64,855,626| $ 1,330,000 Assuria v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 70,627,349




Date of Tender OpeniA1:J18ng: October 1, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (147/2024/44) - Design & Construction of the National Museum

. . Bid Security F f
Bidd . Bid Amount & : . orm of | Hard Flash
|NO.er Name of Bidder ICUIT::C?/ %mount & Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender COT):/ dr’si‘\sle
urrency signed
1 |Origin Investments BSF?ngﬁg]aﬁlﬁtr%dpijlgzid / v v v 2
2 |PME Engineering Consultants BSF?nE::aﬁlgtrzdpijlgzid / v v v 2
3 |Innovative Engineerng Consultancy Services BSF?ngr?(:inapllﬁtrzdpch)asllg:f)d / v v v 1 2
4 |Kalitech Inc Financial Propsoal Sub v v v 2
5 |Consulting Engineers & Planners Guyana BSF?ngr?(:inapllﬁtrzdpch)asllg:f)d / v v v 2
6 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service BSD Completed & Signed / v v v 2

Financial Propsoal Sub




