Date of '	Tender Opening: November 5, 2024								
File Nun	nber: Guyana Power & Light (311/2024/02) - Supply & Deliver	y of ITE Switchgear Spares							
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	BDE Guyana LLC	\$ 103,929,550		No Bid Security Seen	✓	√	✓		2

File Nun	nber: Guyana Power & Light (312/2024/02) - Supply & Deliver	y of CMC	356 Three Phase Prote	ection 1	Relay Test Set						
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Ar	nount & Currency	Bid	Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Professional Energy Services NV	\$	148,390 USD			No Bid Security Seen	>	√	\	1	2
2	SPR Enterprises	\$	13,554,750	\$	271,095	Assuria	>	√	✓		2

File Nun	nber: Guyana Power & Light (313/2024/02) - Supply & Deliver	y of Switches								
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Se	ecurity Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies	\$ 600,000.00 USD	\$	2,371,200	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Fix It Depot	\$ 1,420,020.00 USD	\$	30,000 USD	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	SPR Enterprises	\$ 925,807,020	\$	19,000,000	Assuria	√	√	√		2
4	Salco Electric Company	\$ 1,628,452.20 USD	\$	35,000 USD	Seguros Sura Bank	N/A	N/A	√		2

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sports (160/2024/44) - Procurement of Musical Instruments National School of Music

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	id Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	
1	Music Unlimited	\$	34,000,000	\$ 680,000	Premier	✓	✓	>		0
2	Joey 2 Kool Production	\$	28,999,500	\$ 579,990	Assuria	√	√	√		2
3	The Kunjaz Group	\$	29,698,000	\$ 593,560	Assuria	√	√	√		2

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (31/2024/01) - Design, Supply, Installation & Commissioning of Solar Photovoltic Systems and Distribution Networks for Hinterland Communities In Guyana

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	F	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Green Energy Electrical Services	\$	291,988,570	\$ 9,000,000	Premier	^	✓	\	1	2
2	MEP Engineering Services Inc	\$	391,641,485	\$ 11,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	2020 FMCG Inc	\$	224,723,913	\$ 4,500,000	Republic	✓	√	√		2

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (403/2024/51) - Construction of Officer Living Quarter Bridge Lusignan

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid An	nount & Currency	Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Urban Edge Builders Inc.	\$	29,543,850	\$ 800,000	Assuria	X	√	√		2
2	Blue Print Builders Inc	\$	32,245,500	\$ 790,000	Assuria	✓	√	✓		2
3	K&S Construction Services	\$	25,260,060		No Bid Security Seen	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Sovereignty Construction Services	\$	28,993,125	\$ 600,000	Assuria	\	✓	✓		2
5	Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services	\$	25,394,250	\$ 507,885	Assuria	>	✓	✓		2
6	STP Investments Inc.	\$	32,729,550	\$ 654,591	Premier	>	✓	✓		2
7	A Alli Construction	\$	35,122,500	\$ 702,450	Premier	>	✓	✓		2
8	Construct It Inc	\$	38,413,200	\$ 768,264	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Harry Chowtie Enterprise	\$	41,234,550	\$ 840,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	KNV Designs Construction & Supplies	\$	21,874,680	\$ 800,000	Nafico	>	✓	✓		2
11	Energy Empire	\$	34,014,750	\$ 500,000	Caricom	>	✓	✓		2
12	Andrect Engineering & Construction	\$	46,261,950	\$ 2,000,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
13	GD's Construction & Supplies	\$	32,239,200	\$ 644,784	Assuria	>	✓	✓		2
14	Navin & Son's Construction	\$	28,973,700	\$ 579,474	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
15	Fazam Future Builders	\$	65,969,400	\$ 4,242,560	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	A&J Construction Services	\$	39,062,730	\$ 740,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Guybiz Establishment	\$	34,143,186	\$ 682,864	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc.			\$ 898,254	Caricom (Form of Tender Page Not Completed & Signed)	>	√	X	1	0
19	Truck Smart	\$	34,167,000	\$ 700,000	Premier	>	✓	✓		2
20	C Sohan Construction Services				No Bid Security Seen (Form of Tender Page Not Completed & Signed)	√	X	X		2
21	Sherriff Construction Inc.	\$	34,671,000	\$ 900,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
22	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$	28,806,750	\$ 600,000	Caricom	✓	✓	√		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$	29,807,400							

File Number: Hinterland Electrification Co. Inc (337/2024/02) - Supply of One New Generator for Matthew's Ridge Power & Light Co. Inc

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	d Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	
1	Farm Supplies Limited	\$ 7,650,000	\$ 153,000	Assuria	✓	\	>		2
2	Industrial Supply of Guyana Inc	\$ 8,901,450	\$ 178,029	Nafico	✓	\	\	1	2
3	Standby Power Engineering Company	\$ 7,789,700	\$ 1,200,000	Assuria	✓	\	>		1
4	Tels Engineering Services	\$ 7,500,000	\$ 400,000	Assuria	✓	\	√		2
5	Engineering & Construction Inc	\$ 10,900,000	\$ 218,000	Nafico	✓	\	✓	2	0

File Nun	nber: Hinterland Electrification (338/2024/02) - Supply	and De	elivery of Poles Mo	ount	ed Transformers	for Hinterland Utilitie	S				
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	id Amount & Currency		Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	SPR Enterprises	\$	\$ 18,676,630		500,000	Assuria	^	>	>		2
2	Tels Engineering Services	\$	20,750,000	\$	500,000	Assuria	^	\	✓		2

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Fisheries Department (402/2024/21) - Installation of Internal Electrical Grid at Onverwagt Prawns Project

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	I	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	MEP Engineering Services Inc	\$	120,646,092	\$ 1,500,000	Premier	✓	\	>		2
2	Alvin Chowramattoo Construction Services	\$	293,167,350	\$ 4,500,000	Caricom	✓	\	>	1	2
3	Cummings Electrical	\$	141,561,233	\$ 2,400,000	Nafico	✓	\	>		2
							·			
	Engineer's Estimate	\$	139,174,875				·			

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Fisheries Department (403/2024/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing of New Floating Paddle Wheel Aerators Boats & Submersible Pumps for the Onverwagt Prawns Project

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	id Amount & Currency	A	Sid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Farm Supplies Limited	\$	31,607,400	\$	632,148	Assuria	✓	\	\		2
2	General Equipment Guyana Limited	\$	27,221,818	\$	544,436	Assuria	✓	\	\		2
3	MS Trading	\$	31,985,000	\$	1,000,000	Premier	✓	\	\		2
4	Modern Agri	\$	24,890,000	\$	600,000	Assuria	✓	\	\		2
5	Gopie Investments Inc	\$	34,369,100	\$	687,382	Premier	✓	✓	√		2

Date of Tender Opening: November 5, 2024 File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (393/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Arc Welding Plant Form of Bidder **Bid Security Amount &** Flash Hard Name of Bidder **Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Agency** GRA NIS Tender Currency No. Copy drive signed General Equipment Guyana Limited 5,520,670 \$ 110,423 \$ Assuria 2

File Nun	nber: Guyana Sugar Corporation (394/2024/21) - Supply	y & Delivery of Seamless Stair	nless Steel Plates/Tubes Lo	ots 1-2					
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Alliance Ivestments L1	\$ 51,225,000	\$ 1,024,500	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
1	Alliance Ivestments L2	\$ 9,131,020	\$ 182,780						
2	TPLB Inc L1	\$ 43,354,500	\$ 867,090	Assuria	✓	√	\		2
2	TPLB Inc L2	\$ 11,038,000	\$ 220,760						
3	Wet Solutions LLC L1	\$ 182,180.00 USD	\$ 4,437.65 USD	PNC Bank	√	√	√		0
3	Wet Solutions LLC L2	\$ 39,702.40 USD							

File Nun	nber: Guyana Sugar Corporation (395/2024/21) - Supply	y & Delivery of One Speed Re	duction Gear Box						
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Cremms Limited	\$ 6,732 USD	\$ 105,000	Assuria (Form of Tender Page Completed But Not Signed)	✓	✓	X		0
2	Electrofix Electrical Services	\$ 2,850,000	\$ 60,000	Republic (Cheque)	√	√	√		2

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (334/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Stationery Supplies 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid A	mount & Currency	Bid	l Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies	\$	71,008,690	\$	1,420,174	Assuria	√	√	✓		2
2	MS Trading	\$	116,527,370	\$	2,500,000	Premier	√	✓	√		2
3	Guybiz Establisment	\$	47,105,250	\$	942,105	Assuria	✓	✓	√		2
4	United Trading & Business Services	\$	60,109,336	\$	1,202,186	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
5	PBS Technologies Guyana Inc	\$	65,903,715	\$	1,126,123	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Optimum Supplies	\$	37,528,971	\$	750,579	Premier	√	✓	✓		2
7	S&S Services	\$	154,734,745	\$	3,094,649	Caricom	✓	✓	√		2
8	Laparkan Trading Guyana Limited	\$	1,078,800			Bid Security Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Regal Stationery & Computer Center	\$	56,039,045	\$	1,120,781	Premier	√	✓	✓		2
10	S&K Construction/Consultancy Services and General Supplies Inc	\$	93,914,731	\$ \$	1,025,774 852,522	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (335/2024/46) - Provision of Sanitact Disposal Services for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bi	id Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Puran Bros Disposal Inc	\$	11,887,399	\$ 237,748	Premier	✓	>	✓		2
2	Service pros Pest Control	\$	9,339,920		Bid Security Declaration Completed & Signed	√	>	✓		1
3	Clean Products & Services	\$	9,619,050		Bid Security Declaration Completed & Signed	√	>	√		1

File Nun	nber: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (336/2024/46) - Pro	ovision of Security	Servi	ces for 2025						
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	Bid Amount & Currency		oid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Centaur Security Services Inc	\$	\$ 226,651,827		4,533,037	Premier	✓	Rec	✓		2
2	Amalgamated Security Service Guyana Inc	\$	196,432,488	\$	3,928,650	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Strategic Action Security Limited	\$	147,443,040	\$	2,948,861	Nafico	√	√	√		2
4	Sentry 21 Security	\$	140,413,161	\$	2,808,263	Nafico	✓	Ltr	✓		2
5	Queensway Security Service Inc	\$	217,324,038	\$	4,347,000	Premier	✓	√	✓		2
6	Sheriff Security Inc	\$	188,820,936	\$	3,776,419	Assuria	✓	✓	√		2
7	Panthers Security Service Inc	\$	152,791,920	\$	3,055,838	Premier	✓	√	✓		2
8	Accusafe Security Service Inc	\$	180,753,840	\$	3,615,076	Assuria	√	Ltr	√		2
9	RK's Guyana Security Service	\$	202,475,737	\$	4,100,000	Premier	√	✓	✓		1
10	LA Security Solution Inc	\$	163,496,762	\$	3,269,935	Nafico	√	X	√	_	2

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (337/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Laboratory & Radiology

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid An	nount & Currency	ecurity Amount Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	S&K Construction/Consultancy Services	\$	73,315,451	\$ 600,505	Caricom	./	./	√		2
1	and General Supplies	Ф	73,313,431	\$ 865,805	Caricom	•	V	•		2
2	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$	96,996,134	\$ 1,441,389	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
3	ABD Medicare Investment Inc	\$	72,069,431	\$ 1,441,389	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Mike's Pharmacy	\$	1,445,000	\$ 28,900	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
5	KD Enterprise	\$	42,636,000	\$ 900,000	Bank of Baroda	√	√	√		2
6	New GPC Inc	\$	163,654,002	\$ 4,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	\		2
7	Western Scientific Company Limited	\$ 51	17,026.10 USD	\$ 4,620,000	Premier	√	✓	√		2

File Nun	nber: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (338/2024/46) - Suppl	y & Delivery of Diet	tary Su	ipplies for 2025						
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid An	nount & Currency		Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	BPI Guyana Inc.	\$	5,915,040	\$	118,301	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Desinco Limited	\$	12,532,690	\$	251,000	Assuria	✓	\	✓		2
3	Memorex Enterprises	\$	130,034,390	\$	2,606,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
4	S&K Construction/Consultancy Services & General Supplies	\$	220,758,468	\$	4,415,170	Caricom	\	<	✓		2
5	Supreme Distributors	\$	13,344,000	\$	282,460	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Deo's Imperial Supplies	\$	152,952,000	\$	3,059,040	Assuria	✓	✓	√		2
7	NT Ventures	\$	151,767,380	\$	4,000,000	Assuria	✓	\	√		2
8	Guybiz Establishment	\$	149,227,044	\$	3,038,872	Assuria	✓	\	√		2
9	R Warton Minimart	\$	45,165,442	\$	903,309	Nafico	✓	√	✓		2
10	MS Trading	\$	134,325,950	\$	3,000,000	Premier	✓	√	√		2
11	HR Distributors	\$	138,983,560	\$	3,600,000	Assuria	✓	✓	√		2

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (339/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Janitorial Supplies for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid A	mount & Currency		Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	
1	Mike's Pharmacy	\$	\$ 35,751,675		715,033	Premier	√	\	√		2
2	Guybiz Establishment	\$	\$ 314,429,077		\$ 6,288,582 Assuria		✓	✓	✓		2
3	United Trading & Business Services	\$	19,538,925	\$	390,778	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies	\$	114,129,800	\$	2,282,596	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
5	MS Trading	\$	\$ 105,047,493		2,500,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	New GPC Inc	\$	201,763,860	\$	4,500,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Desinco Limited	\$	58,862,983	\$	1,178,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Fortune Investment Company					No Bid Security Seen (Form of Tender Page Not Completed But Signed)	✓	>	X		1
9	Memorex Enterprise	\$	166,750,750	\$	3,340,000	Caricom	✓	√	✓		2
10	S&S Services	\$	\$ 166,750,750 \$ 120,364,755		2,407,295	Caricom	✓	√	√		2

Date of Tender Opening: November 5, 2024

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (340/2024/46) - Provision of Pest Control Services 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder		unt & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Service Pros Pest Control	\$	12,041,600	\$ 240,832	Republic (Cheque)	\	✓	\		1
2	GuyPestco	\$	30,155,600		No Bid Security Seen	√	✓	√		2

Date of Tender Opening: November 5, 2024 File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (341/2024/46) - Provision of Attendant Services 2025 **Bid Security** Form of Bidder **Bid Amount &** Hard Flash Name of Bidder **Bid Security Agency NIS** Amount & **GRA** Tender Copy No. Currency drive Currency signed 272,693,814 \$ Cleaners 'R' Us Inc 6,000,000 Caricom **√** 2

File N	File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (342/2024/46) - Collection & Disposal of Sewage for 2025													
Bidde No.	Name of Bidder	Bi	id Amount & Currency		Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive			
1	Puran Bros Disposal Inc	\$	7,404,300	\$	148,086	Premier	✓	>	>		2			
2	Cevon's Waste Management Inc	\$	13,725,000	\$	300,000	Assuria	√	\	√		2			

File Nun	File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (343/2024/46) - Collection & Disposal of Non -Infectious Waste for 2025												
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	id Amount & Currency		Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive		
1	Puran Bros Disposal Inc	\$	50,076,000	\$	1,001,520	Premier	>	>	>		2		
2	Cevon's Waste Management Inc	\$	38,859,600	\$	900,000	Assuria	√	✓	√		2		

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (344/2024/46) - Provision of Weeding & Cleaning Service for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency A		Bid Security ant & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 31,979,560	\$	639,591	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
2	SB Logistics & Construction	\$ 16,555,000	\$	772,100	Premier	✓	√	✓		2
3	Baroque Engineering & Construction Services	\$ 14,000,000	\$	280,000	Citizens Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Anchor Construction, Maintenance & Sanitation Services	\$ 11,699,190	\$	233,983	Premier	✓	✓	√		2
5	Toners 'R' Us	\$ 6,089,900	\$	121,798	Premier	√	✓	✓		2
6	Fortune Investment Company				No Bid Security Seen (Form of Tender Page Not Completed But Signed)	✓	✓	✓		2
	O'neil Engineering & General Construction Services	\$ 6,178,000			No Bid Security Seen	✓	✓	✓		0
8	Satesh Narine	\$ 7,594,400	\$	180,000	Assuria	√	✓	✓		2
9	Tristone Investment & Auto Sales	\$ 121,563,150	\$	402,950	Premier	√	√	✓		1

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (345/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Opthamology Supplies for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	В	id Amount & Currency	Currency		Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
				\$	880,000						
1	Optique Vision Care	\$	80,226,460	\$	520,000	Assuria	√	√	√		2
_	Optique Vision Care	Ψ	00,220,400	\$	120,000	Assuria	V	•	V		2
			55 250 400		260,000						
2	MS Trading	\$	55,258,400	\$	1,800,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$	13,860,000	\$	277,200	Nafico	√	√	√		2
4	Western Scientific Company Limited	\$	339,388.90 USD	\$	14,000 USD	Premier	✓	✓	\		2
5	Meditron Inc	\$	29,450,001	\$	589,000	Diamond	√	✓	√		2
6	Eye See You Ophthalmic	\$	158,983,942.55	\$	3,179,679	Premier	N/A	N/A	✓		1
7	New GPC Inc	\$	171,852,985	\$	3,800,000	Premier	✓	√	✓		2
8	BPI Guyana Inc	\$	60,360,814	\$	1,217,216	Assuria	✓	√	✓		2

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (346/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Pharmaceuticals for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bi	d Amount & Currency	Bid S	Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Exclusive Pharmaceutical Supplies	\$	534,029,255.10			No Bid Security Seen (Form of Tender Page	>	√	√		2
	T	,	, ,			Retyped)			•		_
2	Global Health Care Supplies Inc	\$	219,277,157.93	\$	4,385,544	Republic	✓	√	✓		2
3	Desinco Limited	\$	1,060,972,861.00	\$	22,000,000	Assuria	>	✓	✓		2
4	BPI Guyana Inc	\$	176,077,070.00	\$	3,521,541	Assuria	\	✓	√		2
5	New GPC Inc	\$	2,082,021,434.00	\$	48,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Massive Distribution Guyana Inc	\$	133,894,540.00	\$	2,677,891	Republic	\	√	√		2
7	Mike's Pharmacy	\$	375,407,496.00	\$	7,508,150	Premier	✓	√	✓		2
8	Chirosyn Discovery Technologies Inc	\$	707,398,431.00	\$	14,200,000	Demerara	N/A	N/A	√		2
9	Ansa Mcal Distribution Inc	\$	703,552,055.00	\$	14,071,041	GTM	\	√	✓		2
10	DGI Distribution Inc	\$	69,972,510.00	\$	1,400,000	Caricom	\	√	✓		2
11	KD Enterprise	\$	62,445,180.00	\$	1,300,000	Bank of Baroda	√	✓	✓		2
12	Talents & Trading Inc	\$	149,814,455.03	\$	2,996,289	Assuria	√	√	✓	1	1

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (347/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Pathology Supplies for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency		Bid Security Amount & Currency		Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	
1	Clever Solutions Limited	\$	\$ 1,770,375,560.85		36,000,000	Assuria	✓	✓	\		2
2	Western Scientific Company Limited	\$	4,183,668.65 USD	\$	155,000 USD	Premier	N/A	N/A	✓		2
3	New GPC Inc	\$	532,281,162.00	\$	11,000,000	Premier	√	✓	√		2
4	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$	599,839,146.00	\$	11,996,783	Nafico	\	\	✓		2
5	S&K Construction/Consultancy Services	\$	40,145,193.00	\$	336,214	Caricom	I	./	J		2
	& General Supplies Inc	Ψ	40,143,173.00	\$	466,691	Caricom		V	>		2
6	ABD Medicare Investments Inc	\$	55,879,523.00	\$	1,117,591	Nafico	✓	√	✓		2
7	Meditron Inc	\$	296,561,405.00	\$	5,931,228	Diamond	>	>	>		2
8	MS Trading	\$	72,258,500.00	\$	2,000,000	Premier	√	√	√		2
9	Mike's Pharmacy	\$	25,000,000.00	\$	500,000	Premier	√	√	√		2

File Nur	File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (348/2024/46) - Provision of Floor Care & Janitorial Services for 2025											
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid A	Bid Amount & Currency		Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive	
1	Cleaners 'R' Us Inc	\$	261,213,554	\$	6,000,000	Caricom	✓	✓	√		2	

File Number: Guyana Public Hospital Corporation (370/2024/46) - Supply & Delivery of Medical Supplies for 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid A	Bid Amount & Currency		d Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Clever Solutions Limited	\$	\$ 426,546,247.05		8,600,000	Assuria	\	√	√		2
2	CEDI Europe	\$	205,457,996.70	\$	5,250,000	Assuria	N/A	N/A	√		2
3	Western Scientific Company Limited	\$ 4,1	86,344.97 USD	\$	165,000 USD	Premier	N/A	N/A	✓		2
4	Mike's Pharmacy	\$	36,867,350.00	\$	737,342	Premier	>	✓	✓		2
5	Ansa Mcal Distribution Inc	\$	78,789,690.00	\$	1,575,793	GTM	√	✓	✓		2
6	New GPC Inc	\$	465,763,632.00	\$	10,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Global Healthcare Supplies Inc	\$	185,128,291.00	\$	3,702,566	Republic	√	✓	√		2
8	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$	314,707,276.00	\$	6,294,146	Nafico	√	✓	√		2
9	Talents & Trading Inc	\$	811,225,179.95	\$	16,224,504	Assuria	√	✓	√		1
10	Dental Imports Guyana Inc	\$	169,844,140.00	\$	3,396,883	Premier	√	✓	✓		2
11	ABD Medicare Investments Inc	\$	71,060,724.00	\$	1,421,215	Nafico	√	✓	√		2
12	Brandon Establishment Zone	\$	69,104,520.00	\$	1,200,000	Assuria	√	✓	√		2
13	S&K Construction/Consultancy Services &	\$	990,103,268.00	\$	19,040,294	Caricom	√	√	√		2
13	General Supplies Inc	Ψ	\$ 990,103,268.00		761,762	Caricom	>	V	•		2
14	KD Enterprise	\$	220,932,000.00	\$	4,400,000	Bank of Baroda	\	✓	√		2
15	Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies	\$	285,041,000	\$	5,700,820	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
16	Meditron Inc	\$	105,957,700	\$	2,119,154	Diamond	✓	✓	✓		2

File Number: Environmental Protection Agency (246/2024/01) - Provisiomn of Unarmed (Baton) Security Services at EPA Head Office & Whim Sub Office January to December 2025

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	I	Bid Amount & Currency		Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Sheriff Security Inc	\$	25,100,064	\$	502,002	Assuria	>	√	\		2
2	Force Security Solutions	\$	23,608,200	\$	480,000	Premier	\	√	✓		1
3	Amalgamated Security Services Inc	\$	25,964,640	\$	519,293	Assuria	>	√	\		2
4	Castle Security Services Inc	\$	17,969,364	\$	200,000	Premier	>	√	>		2
5	Applied Services	\$	36,064,635	\$	750,000	Premier	>	√	>		1
6	Strategic Action Security Services	\$	18,423,129	\$	368,463	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Acusafe Security Service	\$	25,964,640	\$	519,293	Assuria	>	✓	>		2
8	Century 21 Security	\$	19,392,768	\$	387,855	Nafico	>	√	>		2
9	Panther Security Service Inc	\$	19,972,800	\$	399,456	Premier	>	✓	>		2
10	RK's Security Services	\$	26,747,245	\$	600,000	Premier	\	√	✓		2
11	Elite Protection Services Inc	\$	31,097,376	\$	621,948	Premier	√	√	√		2

File Number: Ministry of Legal Affairs (129/2024/52) - Restorative Justice Centre-Fort Wellington

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	l Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Motiram Construction	\$ 2,488,431		Bid Security Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	√	√		2
2	R,A&D Construction Firm	\$ 2,505,272		Bid Security Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	√	√		1
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 2,606,945							