Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (123/2024/31 Fin) - Consultancy Services for: Social & Gender Resilience Building-Linden to Mabura Hill

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 A-Z Informatlgn Jamaica Limited (89.31) US $236.250.00 N/A | N/A v 5 1
Excluding Indirect Local Taxes
Insuco International Limited, Merundoi Inc
2 1(96.94) Excluding Indirect Local Taxes US $152,182.58 N/A | N/A v 2 1

Estimated Local Taxes

US $27,392.86




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (02/2025/02) - Supply, Installation & Commissioning of MV Switchgear & Associated Equipment

. . Bid Security Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flgsh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Fixit Depot L1 US $967,000 US $35,000 Caricom v v v 2
1 |Fixit Depot L2 US $675,000
1 |Fixit Depot L3 US $29,835
1 |Fixit Depot L4 US $63,150
2 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L1 |$ 90,362,680 | $ 3,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L2 $ 20,742,988
2 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L3 | $ 22,761,225




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (495/2024/21) - Rehabilitation of Boiler House Roof Structure at Blairmont Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁg'er Name of Bidder Blcéﬁrnr]:#cr;t & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender 22;(; l;lr?\s/z
Currency signed
1 |Great One Investment $ 63,540,000 $ 1,440,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |AYN Construction & General Services $ 56,700,200 $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 49,136,950




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (01/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of the Printing of Promotional Materials & Medical Records Lots 1-5

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency %Tﬁrenr:;c Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :iegnntizr Copy | drive
1 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L1 $ 80,854,025 |$% 2,891,256 Assuria v v v 2

1 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L2 $ 16,570,000

1 [PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L3 $ 33,132,500

1 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L4 $ 6,656,250

1 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L5 $ 7,350,000

2 |JK Printing L3 $ 13,610,000 | $ 799,080 Assuria v v v 2
2 |JK Printing L4 $ 26,000,000

2 |JK Printing L5 $ 344,000

3 |Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L1 $ 38,441,600 | $ 892,052 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L2 $ 6,161,000

4 |AlPrint & Supplies L1 $ 51,251,000 |$% 1,025,020 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Al Print & Supplies L2 $ 5,647,500 | $ 112,950

4 |Al Print & Supplies L3 $ 26,264,500 | $ 485,290

4 |Al Print & Supplies L4 $ 35,290,000 | $ 705,800

4 |Al Print & Supplies L5 $ 5,035,000 | $ 100,700

5 |Image Makers Guyana $ 1,387,024 Assuria (No Form of v v X 2

Tender Page Seen)




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (02/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Dietary Supplies Lots 1-5

Bid Security

Form of

Bi,iljder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI?Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L1 $ 24563500 $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
1 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2 $ 6,172,160
1 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3 $ 10,868,475
1 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L4 $ 9,921,492
1 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L5 $ 18,403,200
2 |Triple E General Services L1 $ 46,560,000 | $ 908,800 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Triple E General Services L2 $ 27,506,600
2 |Triple E General Services L3 $ 55,737,750
2 |Triple E General Services L4 $ 59,845,400
2 |Triple E General Services L5 $ 92,160,000
3 |Paradise Food Products L1 $ 15224500 |$ 1,176,703 Diamond v v v 2
3 |Paradise Food Products L2 $ 5,779,191
3 |Paradise Food Products L3 $ 11,210,775
3 |Paradise Food Products L4 $ 8,483,894

. $ 18,136,800
3 |Paradise Food Products L5 $  58.835.160
4 |Klassic Supplies L1 $ 14,238,500 | $ 284,770 Diamond v v v 2
4 |Klassic Supplies L2 $ 5,225,715 | $ 104,514
4 |Klassic Supplies L3 $ 6,697,875 | $ 133,957




5 |Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 20,712,000 | $ 1,749,331 Assuria
5 |Guybiz Establishment L2 $ 8,245,032
5 |Guybiz Establishment L3 $ 19,238,400
5 |Guybiz Establishment L4 $ 15,892,728
5 |Guybiz Establishment L5 $ 23,378,400
6 |P&P Investment L1 $ 8,774,960 | $ 524,976 Assuria
6 |P&P Investment L2 $ 3,236,790
6 |P&P Investment L3 $ 4,400,130
6 |P&P Investment L4 $ 3,593,796
6 |P&P Investment L5 $ 6,243,120
7 |Memorex Enterprise L1 $ 16,710,100 | $ 1,370,000 Caricom
7 |Memorex Enterprise L2 $ 6,499,770
7 |Memorex Enterprise L3 $ 13,661,130
7 |Memorex Enterprise L4 $ 12,778,099
7 |Memorex Enterprise L5 $ 18,201,600
8 |R. Warton Minimart L1 $ 14,588,220 | $ 730,987 Nafico
8 |R. Warton Minimart L2 $ 3,731,942
8 |R. Warton Minimart L4 $ 6,676,814
9 |Andrew's Enterprise L1 $ 6,667,516 | $ 786,748 Assuria
9 |Andrew's Enterprise L2 $ 2,236,250.90
9 |Andrew's Enterprise L3 $ 7,308,911.25




9 |Andrew's Enterprise L4 $ 6,506,764.40
9 |Andrew's Enterprise L5 $ 16,617,960
10 |Her Dynasty L1 $ 22,302,000 1,188,411 Caricom
10 |Her Dynasty L4 $ 15,122,595
10 |[Her Dynasty L5 $ 21,996,000
11 |[Phoenix Industries L1 $ 14,501,500 1,000,000 Assuria
11 [Phoenix Industries L2 $ 6,589,470
11 |Phoenix Industries L3 $ 13,911,750
11 |Phoenix Industries L4 $ 10,312,140
12 [NT Ventures L1 $ 22,712,000 1,760,000 Assuria
12 [NT Ventures L2 $ 8,686,860
12 [NT Ventures L3 $ 16,527,750
12 [NT Ventures L4 $ 13,675,412
12 [NT Ventures L5 $ 25,452,000
13 |P. Ramroop & Sons L1 $ 15,364,000 1,078,001 Caricom
13 |P. Ramroop & Sons L2 $ 5,090,764
13 |P. Ramroop & Sons L3 $ 11,297,775
13 [P. Ramroop & Sons L4 $ 7,722,324
13 |P. Ramroop & Sons L5 $ 14,425,200
14 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L1 $ 24,988,530 1,749,593 Premier
14 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2 $ 7,755,573




14 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3 $ 16,225,871

14 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4 $ 13,675,043

14 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L5 $ 24,834,600

15 |Mohamed's Manufacturing Enterprise L1 $ 26,340,100 | $ 2,227,500 | RBGL (Cheque)
15 [Mohamed's Manufacturing Enterprise L2 $ 11,003,050

15 [Mohamed's Manufacturing Enterprise L3 $ 21,960,150

15 |[Mohamed's Manufacturing Enterprise L4 $ 15,721,854

15 [Mohamed's Manufacturing Enterprise L5 $ 36,226,800

16 [(Unkown) 2 Softcopies Submitted Only

17 [(Unkown) 2 Softcopies Submitted Only

18 [HR Distributors L1 $ 23,147,200 | $ 1,800,000 Assuria
18 [HR Distributors L2 $ 8,723,620

18 [HR Distributors L3 $ 16,805,550

18 [HR Distributors L4 $ 13,921,460

18 [HR Distributors L5 $ 24,364,800

19 |LC Investment & General Supplies L1 $ 20,308,310 | $ 1,628,419 Premier
19 |LC Investment & General Supplies L2 $ 9,200,852

19 [LC Investment & General Supplies L3 $ 19,497,983

19 [LC Investment & General Supplies L4 $ 12,665,263

19 [LC Investment & General Supplies L5 $ 19,748,520




20 |Safar's Construction Enterprise L1 $ 19,983,480 No Bid Security Seen
20 |Safar's Construction Enterprise L2 $ 8,645,134

20 |Safar's Construction Enterprise L3 $ 22,285,665

20 |Safar's Construction Enterprise L4 $ 14,553,046

20 |Safar's Construction Enterprise L5 $ 27,327,600

21 |General Distributors L1 $ 16,908,000 | $ 1,506,760 Caricom
21 |General Distributors L2 $ 8,561,714

21 |General Distributors L3 $ 18,004,800

21 |General Distributors L4 $ 11,762,158

21 |General Distributors L5 $ 20,101,320




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (03/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Field Materials for Program 1-8 Lots 1-4

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(\:T?Eenr;[ci Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'sl'iegnn(izr Copy | drive
1 |P. Ramroop & Sons L1 $ 5,953,890 | $ 368,603 Caricom v v v 2

1 |P. Ramroop & Sons L2 $ 4,988,640

1 |P. Ramroop & Sons L3 $ 2,733,240

1 |P. Ramroop & Sons L4 $ 4,754,386

2 |E&R Establishment L1 $ 189,266,000 |$ 1,298,230 Assuria v v v 2

2 |E&R Establishment L2 $ 348,271,000

2 |E&R Establishment L3 $ 163,139,000

2 |E&R Establishment L4 $ 28,979,450

3 |Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies L1 $ 28,857,780 | $ 577,155 Assuria v v v 2

3 |Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies L2 $ 24,680,220 | $ 493,604

3 |Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies L3 $ 6,790,445 | $ 135,808

4 Impec.cable Construction & General $ 40391800 | $ 2953782 Caricom v v v 5
Supplies Inc L1

4 Impec.cable Construction & General $ 56834400
Supplies Inc L2

4 Impeccable Construction & General $ 38552100

Supplies Inc L3




Impeccable Construction & General

4 Supplies Inc L4 $ 11,910,776
5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L1 $ 89,546,700 5,140,648 Caricom
5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2 $ 79,175,040
5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L3 $ 76,791,820
5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L4 $ 11,518,796
6 |Meditron Inc L1 $ 27,575,796 1,908,618 Diamond
6 |Meditron Inc L2 $ 49,780,720
6 |Meditron Inc L3 $ 17,055,118
6 |Meditron Inc L4 $ 1,019,280
7 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L1 $ 30,354,240 1,000,000 Caricom
7 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2 $ 61,267,650
7 |INS Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3 $ 16,810,130
8 |General Distributors L1 $ 24,656,658 1,338,892 Caricom
8 |General Distributors L2 $ 19,954,190
8 |General Distributors L3 $ 13,232,713
8 |General Distributors L4 $ 9,100,015
9 |True Value Trading L1 $ 40,187,000 3,443,401 Caricom
9 |True Value Trading L2 $ 92,151,140
9 |True Value Trading L3 $ 39,831,905




10 ([Health Sales Global Inc L1 $ 52577028 |$ 4,734,412 Nafico

10 [Health Sales Global Inc L2 $ 68,723,760

10 [Health Sales Global Inc L3 $ 102,393,660

10 [Health Sales Global Inc L4 $ 13,026,153

11 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L1 $ 13,692,408 | $ 1,400,755 Premier
11 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2 $ 34,718,760

11 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3 $ 19,102,356

11 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4 $ 2,524,194

12 |New GPC Inc L1 $ 17,070,720 | $ 1,100,000 Premier
12 [New GPC Inc L2 $ 22,818,900

12 [New GPC Inc L3 $ 13,311,025

13 [Paradise Food Products L1 $ 4,798,070 | $ 400,591 Diamond
13 |Paradise Food Products L2 $ 9,870,440

13 |Paradise Food Products L3 $ 5,361,060




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (04/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Janitorial Supplies Program 1-8 Lots 1-2

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh

0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
General Distributors L1 $ 229,156,110 :

1 General Distributors L2 $ 12,478,228 $ 4,840,000 Caricom v v v 2
Memorex Enterprise L1 $ 157,224,610 :

2 Memorex Enterprise L2 $ 12,784,060 $ 3:430,000 Caricom v v v 2
Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L1 53,674,100 :

3 J : Y P S $ 1,181,297 Premier v v v 2
Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L2 $ 5,390,000
Her Dynasty L1 $ 76,813,490 :

4 Her Dynasty L2 3 5.663 240 $ 1,669,534 Caricom v v v 2
Shenade Akasai Logistics L1 $ 119,488,300 :

> Shenade Akasai Logistics L2 $ 11,450,390 $ 2618772 Premier v v v 2
Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 175,539,760 .

®  [Guybiz Establishment L2 $ 13188024 | > O774556)  Assuria A A 2

7 Safar's Construction Enterprise L1 $ 377,737,370 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

Safar's Construction Enterprise L2

$ 24,857,327




K&K Boat Building Construction & General

: $ 168,650,000 |$ 3,373,020
8 Supplies L1 Caricom
K&K _Boat Building Construction & General $ 13111920 | $ 2.262.239
Supplies L2
AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L1 $ 234,598,438 :
J AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2 $ 274,521,520 $ 10710242 Caricom
Next-Gen Enterprise L1 $ 360,389,820 :
10 Next-Gen Enterprise L2 $ 50,107,215 $ 8209941 Assuria
A&Z Halaal Butchery L1 $ 422,750,669 :
11 TA&Z Ralaal Butchery L2 $  49412011] > O#43.272)  Premier
P&P Investment L1 $ 41,884,479 :
12 152P Investment L2 s 7824a06) > 0477 Assuria
13 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L1 $ 159,706,366|$ 3,194,127 Nafico
A&A Business Investments L1 $ 116,444,440 : :
14 [A&A Business Investments L2 $ 17,051,120 No Bid Security Seen
15 A Alli Construction L1 $ 106,325,000 [$ 2,126,000 Premier
A Alli Construction L2 $ 13,324,400 | $ 266,488




Impeccable Construction & General Supplies

Inc L1 217,972,958
16 Irr:1C eccable Construction & General Supplies 10,710,242 Caricom
P PP 317,539,120
Inc L2
Khal ' hemical Limited L1 137,081,055 _
17 alama'at C em!ca s Company !m!ted 37,081,0 2 751793 Caricom
Khalama'at Chemicals Company Limited L2 508,500
P. Ramroop & Sons L1 75,816,400 :
18 15 Ramroop & Sons L2 6,336,123 > 643,050} Caricom
New GPC Inc L1 148,075,841 :
19 [New GPC Inc L2 0,262,075| > 4000001 Premier
Paradise Food Products L1 121,011,830 :
20 Paradise Food Products L2 7,097,582 2,962,588 Diamond
United Trading & Business Services L1 10,048,900 :
21 United Trading & Business Services L2 1,641,916 233,816 Assuria
99 Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies L1 35,762,540 715,250 Assuria
Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies L2 11,191,490 223,829
93 Al Print & Supplies L1 271,254,800 5,425,096 Assuria
Al Print & Supplies L2 24,875,450 497,502




2 Frig Value Trading 12 15U s 4197.320|  Caricom
25 |TViCA Supplies & Servioes L2 S iog1dg S 2050983|  Premier
26 | Andrews Entrpise L2 Coeone] © L4913 Assui
21| C invesment & Geneal upplis L2 o7ap7s O 249718 Premier




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (05/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Stationery Supplies for Program 1-8

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'frzrnn;eorf Hard Fla_lsh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy| drive
1 [Impecable Construction & General Supplies Inc. $ 466,502,450 $ 9,330,049 Caricom v v v 1
2 |New GPC Inc. $ 6,858,400 $ 140,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Mica Supplies & Services $ 154,699,000 $ 3,093,980 Premier v v v 2
4 |Vishal Landscaping & Office Supplies $ 74,050,310 $ 1,481,006 Assuria v v v 2
5 |P&P Investments Limited $ 32,840,276| $ 656,806 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Meditron Inc. $ 146,866,084 $ 2,937,322 Diamond v v v 2
7 |(Unkown) 2 Softcopies Submitted Only - - - X X X 2
8 |K&K Boat Building Construction & General Supplies $ 387,008,500 | $ 3,373,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |True Value Trading $ 81955730 9% 1,639,114 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Her Majesty $ 78,355,200 | $ 1,567,104 Caricom v v v 2
11 |ARCS Regium Logistics and Solutions Inc. $ 55497,709 | $ 1,109,954 Nafico v v v 2
12 |A&A Business Investments $ 253,429,260 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
13 |A&Z Halaal Butchery $ 139,951,845 | $ 2,799,037 Premier v v v 1
14 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. $ 511,773,170 | $ 10,235,464 Caricom v v v 1
15 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre $ 60,441,900 | $ 1,208,838 Premier v v v 2
16 |SD Investment & General Supplies $ 140,093,400 | $ 2,801,868 Nafico v v v 1
17 |United Trading & Business Services $ 15,586,219 | $ 311,724 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Next Gen Enterprise $ 201,440,281 | $ 4,028,806 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Health Sales Global Inc. $ 285,667,658 | $ 5,713,353 Nafico v v v 2
20 |A Alli Construction $ 193,114,360 | $ 3,862,287 Premier v v v 2
21 |Optimum Supplies $ 23,523,736 | $ 470,475 Premier v v v 2
22 |Al Print & Supplies $ 188,859,170 | $ 3,852,784 Assuria v v v 2
23 | The Office Cart $ 154,589,754 | $ 5,200,000 Assuria X X v 2
24 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors $ 118,067,250 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 2




25 |Shenade Akasi Logistics $ 127,830,840 | $ 2,556,617 Premier v v v 2
26 |Safar's Construction Enterprise $ 153,238,706 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
27 |Paradise Food Products $ 85,256,035 | $ 1,705,121 Diamond v v v 2
28 |Andrew's Enterprise $ 49,260,459 | $ 985,209 Assuria v v v 2
29 |D&S Printery & Stationery Supplies $ 87,247,290 | $ 1,624,946 Premier v v v 2
30 [P. Ramroop & Sons $ 71,318,586 | $ 1,426,371 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (21/2025/45) - Procurement of Conductors Lots 1-5

. . Bid Security Form of
Blﬂder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Twins Enterprise L1 $ 102,689,000 $ 1,615,335 Assuria v v v 1
1 |Twins Enterprise L2 $ 102,689,000 $ 1,615,335
1 |Twins Enterprise L3 $ 102,689,000 $ 1,615,335
1 |Twins Enterprise L4 $ 102,689,000 $ 1,615,335
1 |Twins Enterprise L5 $ 102,689,000 $ 1,615,335
2 |Akamaiinc. L1 $ 133,086,300 | $ 1,997,000 RBGL (Cheque) v v v 1 0
3 ﬁ.lJagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 108.417.400 | $ 2250000 Premier v Y v 5
3 i.ZJagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 108417400
3 iéJagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 108417400
3 i.4Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 108417400
3 iéJagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 108417400
4 |Blue Print Builders Inc. L1 $ 132,264,000 | $ 6,800,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 |Blue Print Builders Inc. L2 $ 132,264,000
4 |Blue Print Builders Inc. L3 $ 132,264,000
4 |Blue Print Builders Inc. L4 $ 132,264,000
4 |Blue Print Builders Inc. L5 $ 132,264,000




5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. L1 $ 101,657,000 |$ 2,033,140 Caricom v v
5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. L2 $ 101,657,000

5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. L3 $ 101,657,000

5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. L4 $ 101,657,000

5 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc. L5 $ 101,657,000

6 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $470,231 US $10,000 Caricom N/A | N/A
6 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $470,232 US $10,001

6 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $470,233 US $10,002

6 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $470,234 US $10,003

6 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $470,235 US $10,004

7 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L1 $ 112,696,300 | $ 5,800,000 Nafico v v
7 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L2 $ 112,696,300

7 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L3 $ 112,696,300

7 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L4 $ 112,696,300

7 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L5 $ 112,696,300

8 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 134,764,000 | $ 6,300,000 Assuria v v
8 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 134,764,000

8 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 134,764,000

8 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 134,764,000

8 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 134,764,000

9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 190,055,442 | $ 10,000,000 Caricom v v
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 190,055,442

9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 190,055,442

9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L4 $ 190,055,442




9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L5 $ 190,055,442
10 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 93,311,300 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria v v
10 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 93,311,300
10 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 93,311,300
10 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 93,311,300
10 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 93,311,300
11 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L1 $ 124,103,000 | $ 6,205,150 Assuria X X
11 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L2
11 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L3
11 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L4
11 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L5
12 |Fixit Depot L1 $ 94,796,040 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v
12 |Fixit Depot L2 $ 94,796,040 | $ 3,000,000
12 |Fixit Depot L3 $ 94,796,040 | $ 3,000,000
12 |Fixit Depot L4 $ 94,796,040 | $ 3,000,000
12 |Fixit Depot L5 $ 94,796,040 | $ 3,000,000
Premier (Form of Tender
13 |Henan Kosen Cable $ 18,000,000 | Page Not Completed But | N/A | N/A
Signed)
14 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 137,614,000 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria v v
14 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 137,614,000
14  |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 137,614,000
14 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 137,614,000
14 |Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 137,614,000




15 |Astra Services L1 $ 101,355,000 |$ 7,601,625 Assuria
15 |Astra Services L2 $ 101,355,000
15 |Astra Services L3 $ 101,355,000
15 |Astra Services L4 $ 101,355,000
15 |Astra Services L5 $ 101,355,000
16 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 126,710,000 | $ 8,000,000 Assuria
16 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 126,710,000
16 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 126,710,000
16 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 126,710,000
16 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 126,710,000
17 II_rrIpeccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 112959500 | $ 5647.975 Caricom
17 ILmZpeccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 112959500
17 :_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 112959500
17 ILm4peccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 112959500
17 :_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 112959500
18 |Daks Contracting Services L1 $ 165,754,000 | $ 14,000,000 Caricom
18 |Daks Contracting Services L2 $ 165,754,000
18 |Daks Contracting Services L3 $ 165,754,000
18 |Daks Contracting Services L4 $ 165,754,000
18 |Daks Contracting Services L5 $ 165,754,000




N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

19 ; . 108,724,500 1,690,867 Assuria
Electrical Supplies L1
19 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & 108,724.500 1,690,867
Electrical Supplies L2
19 N Balgobm & S_ons Contracting Service & 108,724,500 1,690,867
Electrical Supplies L3
19 N Balgobln & Spns Contracting Service & 108,724.500 1,690,867
Electrical Supplies L4
19 N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & 108,724,500 1,690,867

Electrical Supplies L5




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (22/2025/45) - Procurement of Electrical Line Hardware Materials Lots 1-5

Bid Security

Form of

Biﬂg'er Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender ggpr);j/ er?\s/z
Currency signed
1 II_rzpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 67127350 $ 1342547 Caricom v v v 1
1 II_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 67 127,350
1 II_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 67127350
1 II_rzpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 67127350
1 II_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 67127350
2 |Astra Services L1 $ 53,861,000 | $ 4,039,575 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Astra Services L2 $ 53,861,000
2 |Astra Services L3 $ 53,861,000
2 |Astra Services L4 $ 53,861,000
2 |Astra Services L5 $ 53,861,000
3 |Henan Kosen Cable L1 (T&T) $ 57,025,687.95 | $ 18,000,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2
3 |Henan Kosen Cable L3 (T&T) $ 57,025,688.00
3 |Henan Kosen Cable L3 (T&T) $ 57,025,688.00
3 |Henan Kosen Cable L3 (T&T) $ 57,025,688.00
4  |Fixit Depot L1 $ 55,341,037.30 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v v 2




4  |Fixit Depot L2 $ 55,341,037.30 | $ 3,000,000
4  |Fixit Depot L3 $ 55,341,037.30 | $ 3,000,000
4  |Fixit Depot L4 $ 55,341,037.30 | $ 3,000,000
4  |Fixit Depot L5 $ 55,341,037.30 | $ 3,000,000
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 56.618.000 | $ 1266280 Assuria
Electrical Supplies L1
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 56.618.000 | $ 1266280
Electrical Supplies L2
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 56.618.000 | $ 1266280
Electrical Supplies L3
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 56.618.000 | $ 1266280
Electrical Supplies L4
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 56.618.000 | $ 1266280
Electrical Supplies L5
6 |Twins Enterprise L1 $ 55,314,000 | $ 1,292,360 Assuria
6 |Twins Enterprise L2 $ 55,314,000 | $ 1,292,360
6 |Twins Enterprise L3 $ 55,314,000 | $ 1,292,360
6 |Twins Enterprise L4 $ 55,314,000 | $ 1,292,360
6 |Twins Enterprise L5 $ 55,314,000 | $ 1,292,360
7 |Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 83,319,000 | $ 6,500,000 Assuria
7 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 83,319,000
7 |Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 83,319,000
7 |Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 83,319,000
7 |Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 83,319,000




8 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 84,982,000 | $ 6,525,000 Assuria
8 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 84,982,000
8 |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 84,982,000
8 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 84,982,000
8 |Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 84,982,000
9 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 60,069,450 | $ 10,000,000 Assuria
9 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 60,069,450
9 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 60,069,450
9 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 60,069,450
9 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 60,069,450
10 [Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 81,589,000 | $ 6,400,000 Assuria
10 [Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 81,589,000
10 [Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 81,589,000
10 [Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 81,589,000
10 [Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 81,589,000
11 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L1 $ 98,229,250 [ $ 7,300,000 Nafico
11 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L2 $ 95,018,100
11 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited L3 $ 95,018,100
11 |[Cummings Electrical Company Limited L4 $ 95,018,100
11 [Cummings Electrical Company Limited L5 $ 95,018,100
12 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 75,808,850 | $ 6,900,000 Assuria
12 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 75,808,850




12 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 75,808,850
12 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 75,808,850
12 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 75,808,850




Date of Tender Opening: January 14, 2025

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (23/2025/45) - Procurement of Single Phase Transformers Lots 1-5

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh

No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 176,640,000 $ 9,500,000 Assuria v v v 1
1 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 176,640,000

1 [Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 176,640,000

1 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 176,640,000

1 [Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 176,640,000

2 |Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 180,140,000 | $ 9,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 180,140,000

2 |Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 180,140,000

2 |Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 180,140,000

2 |Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 180,140,000

3 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 177,929,500 | $ 20,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 177,929,500

3 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 177,929,500

3 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 177,929,500

3 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 177,929,500

4 N Balgobln & Spns Contracting Service & $ 135265000 | $ 2103975 Assuria v v Y 1

Electrical Supplies L1
4 N Balgobm & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 135265000 | $ 2103975
Electrical Supplies L2




N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

4 Electrical Supplies L3 $ 135,265,000 | $ 2,103,975
4 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 135265000 | $ 2,103,975
Electrical Supplies L4
4 N Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 135265000 | $ 2,103,975
Electrical Supplies L5
5 [NT Ventures L1 $ 239,300,000 | $ 12,000,000 Assuria
5 |NT Ventures L2 $ 239,300,000
5 |NT Ventures L3 $ 239,300,000
5 |NT Ventures L4 $ 239,300,000
5 |NT Ventures L5 $ 239,300,000
6 |HR Distributors L1 $ 199,700,000 | $ 10,000,000 Assuria
6 |HR Distributors L2 $ 199,700,000
6 |HR Distributors L3 $ 199,700,000
6 |HR Distributors L4 $ 199,700,000
6 |HR Distributors L5 $ 199,700,000
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 184,140,000 | $ 9,200,000 Assuria
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 184,140,000
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 184,140,000
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 184,140,000
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 184,140,000
8 |AkamaiInc L1 $ 220,116,000 | $ 3,302,000 | RBGL (Cheque)




9 |Power-Lite Products Limited L1 (T&T) US $679,960 US $14,000 Caricom N/A | N/A
9 |Power-Lite Products Limited L2 (T&T) US $679,961

9 |Power-Lite Products Limited L3 (T&T) US $679,962

9 |Power-Lite Products Limited L4 (T&T) US $679,963

9 |Power-Lite Products Limited L5 (T&T) US $679,964

10 |Henan Kosen Cable L1 $ 174,257,058 | $ 18,000,000 Premier v v
10 |Henan Kosen Cable L2 $ 174,257,058

10 |Henan Kosen Cable L3 $ 174,257,058

10 [Henan Kosen Cable L4 $ 174,257,058

10 [Henan Kosen Cable L5 $ 174,257,058

11 {Twins Enterprise L1 $ 141,320,000 | $ 2,191,800 Assuria v v
11 |Twins Enterprise L2 $ 141,320,000 | $ 2,191,800

11 |Twins Enterprise L3 $ 141,320,000 | $ 2,191,800

11 |Twins Enterprise L4 $ 141,320,000 | $ 2,191,800

11 |Twins Enterprise L5 $ 141,320,000 | $ 2,191,800

12 |Daks Contracting Services L1 $ 194,000,700 | $ 15,000,000 Caricom v v
12 |Daks Contracting Services L2 $ 194,000,700

12 [Daks Contracting Services L3 $ 194,000,700

12 [Daks Contracting Services L4 $ 194,000,700

12 [Daks Contracting Services L5 $ 194,000,700

13 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 265,675,586 | $ 14,000,000 Caricom v v
13 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 265,675,586

13 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 265,675,586




13 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L4 $ 265,675,586
13 |[Toolsie Persaud Limited L5 $ 265,675,586
14 |Astra Services L1 $ 125,100,000 | $ 6,255,000 Assuria
14 |Astra Services L2 $ 125,100,000
14 |Astra Services L3 $ 125,100,000
14 |Astra Services L4 $ 125,100,000
14 |Astra Services L5 $ 125,100,000
15 |[Fixit Depot L1 (Option 1) $ 171,416,510 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom
15 |[Fixit Depot L2 (Option 1) $ 171,416,510
15 |[Fixit Depot L3 (Option 1) $ 171,416,510
15 |[Fixit Depot L4 (Option 1) $ 171,416,510
15 |Fixit Depot L5 (Option 1) $ 171,416,510
15 |Fixit Depot L1 (Option 2) $ 194,840,196
15 |Fixit Depot L2 (Option 2) $ 194,840,196
15 |Fixit Depot L3 (Option 2) $ 194,840,196
15 |Fixit Depot L4 (Option 2) $ 194,840,196
15 |Fixit Depot L5 (Option 2) $ 194,840,196
16 Ei]agmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 161915400 | $ 3,000,000 Premier
16 i;agmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 161915400
16 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $  161.915.400

L3




S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc

16 L4 $ 161,915,400

16 ﬁSJagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 161915400

17 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 150,239,700 | $ 8,900,000 Assuria
17 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 150,239,700

17 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 150,239,700

17 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 150,239,700

17 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 150,239,700

18 II_rzpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 126,050,000 | $ 2.521.000 Caricom
18 II_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 126,050,000

18 ILrgpeccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 126,050,000

18 II_rzpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 126,050,000

18 ILrgpeccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 126,050,000

19 |BM Property Investments Inc L1 $ 22,447,000 | $ 11,373,500 Caricom
19 |BM Property Investments Inc L2 $ 22,447,000 | $ 11,373,500

19 |BM Property Investments Inc L3 $ 22,447,000 | $ 11,373,500

19 |BM Property Investments Inc L4 $ 22,447,000 | $ 11,373,500

19 |BM Property Investments Inc L5 $ 22,447,000 | $ 11,373,500




20 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L1 $ 126,385,100 | $ 6,319,255 Assuria
20 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L2 $ 126,385,100

20 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L3 $ 126,385,100

20 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L4 $ 126,385,100

20 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc L5 $ 126,385,100

21 |ARC Brothers Electric Guyana Inc L1 $ 390,347,213 | $ 5,855,208 Premier
21 |ARC Brothers Electric Guyana Inc L2 $ 390,347,213 | $ 5,855,208

21 |ARC Brothers Electric Guyana Inc L3 $ 390,347,213 | $ 5,855,208

21 |ARC Brothers Electric Guyana Inc L4 $ 390,347,213 | $ 5,855,208

21 |ARC Brothers Electric Guyana Inc L5 $ 390,347,213 | $ 5,855,208




