Date of Tender Opening: December 18, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (194/2024/31) - Rehabilitation/Construction of Miscellaneous Roads Phase 9 A Lots 2792-2794

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 [Vulcan Group Inc L2792 $ 73,781,033 1,107,000 Caricom v v v 2

1 [Vulcan Group Inc L2793 $ 96,021,975 1,455,750
1 [Vulcan Group Inc L2794 $ 91,952,595 1,192,500
2 |Metal & Fabrication Ink L2792 $ 73,292,336 1,680,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Metal & Fabrication Ink L2793 $ 72,902,388 1,455,750
2 |Metal & Fabrication Ink L2794 $ 92,260,676 1,192,500
3 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting $ 76,528,200 1,107,000 Caricom Jvlv] v 2
Services Inc L2792
K&S Civil Engineering Contracting
3 Services Inc L2793 $ 97,482,315 1,455,750
K&S Civil Engineering Contracting
3 Services Inc L2794 $ 86,842,035 1,192,500
4 |Cotech Service L2792 $ 65,717,925 1,314,180 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Cotech Service L2793 $ 78,741,810 1,574,836
5 Executive Caribbean Development Guyana $ 67 714,710 1.107.000 Assuria v v v 5

Inc L2792




Executive Caribbean Development Guyana

5 Inc L2793 $ 92,151,780 |$ 1,455,750
5 Executive Caribbean Development Guyana $  77.067.165|$ 1192500
Inc L2794
6 [B&J Civil Works L2792 $ 69,602,420 |$ 1,680,000 Caricom v
6 [|B&J Civil Works L2793 $ 93,276,225 |$ 1,455,750
6 |B&J Civil Works L2794 $ 77,239,943 | $ 1,192,500
7 |Enfield Contracting Company L2792 $ 69,850,725 |$% 1,107,000 Premier v
7 |Enfield Contracting Company L2793 $ 88,503,450 |$ 1,455,750
7 |Enfield Contracting Company L2794 $ 71,957,865 |$ 1,192,500
8 |GD's Construction & Supplies L2792 $ 67,971,120 | $ 1,359,422 Assuria Ltr
8 |GD's Construction & Supplies L2793 $ 79,730,070 | $ 1,594,601
8 |GD's Construction & Supplies L2794 $ 76,346,340 | $ 1,145,195
9 |llyas' Legacy Farms L2792 $ 70,375,725 |$ 1,107,000 Premier Ltr
9 |llyas' Legacy Farms L2793 $ 88,133,450 |$ 1,455,750
9 |llyas' Legacy Farms L2794 $ 71222865 (% 1,192,500
10 R&M Mining Investments Project Inc $ 71213205 |$  1.107.000 Caricom Y
L2792
10 R&M Mining Investments Project Inc $ 95341365 |% 1455750

L2793




R&M Mining Investments Project Inc

10 L2794 $ 78,562,680 |$ 1,192,500
Caricom (Form of
11 [Mohamed's Savannah Ranch Inc L2792 $ 1,107,000 Tender Page Not v
Completed But Signed)
11 [Mohamed's Savannah Ranch Inc L2793 $ 1,455,750
11 [Mohamed's Savannah Ranch Inc L2794 $ 1,192,500
12 |Speedy Group Inc L2792 $ 70,359,870 $ 1,680,000 Caricom Ltr
12 |Speedy Group Inc L2793 $ 90,917,400 $ 1,455,750
12 [Speedy Group Inc L2794 $ 70,243,845 $ 1,192,500
13 Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc $ 67695390 $ 1.107.000 Nafico v
L2792
13 Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc $  78944565| $ 1455750
L2793
13 Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc $  67.941300| $ 1192500
L2794
14 |KNPS Contracting and Supplies L2792 $ 65,241,470 No Bid Security Seen v
14 |KNPS Contracting and Supplies L2793 $ 88,487,910
14 |KNPS Contracting and Supplies L2794 $ 88,746,000




Not Completed

15 |ALCO Distribution and Services Inc : No Bid Security seen v
but signed
16 |KGM Construction and Supply Inc L2792 | $ 73,336,515 1,107,000 Caricom v
16 |KGM Construction and Supply Inc L2793 | $ 95,399,482 1,455,750
16 |KGM Construction and Supply Inc L2794 | $ 77,154,787 1,192,500
17 Troy_ Kowlessar General Construction $ 71132250 1,107,000 Assuria v
Service L2792
17 Troy. Kowlessar General Construction $ 92604645 1455 750
Service L2793
17 Troy. Kowlessar General Construction $  75719.805 1.192.500
Service L2794
18 Shafina Construction & General Services $  62327.265 1,107,000 Premier Ltr
L2792
18 Shafina Construction & General Services $ 83354040 1.455.750
L2793
18 Shafina Construction & General Services $  64.792.665 1.192.500

L2794




Alliance Construction and General

19 Supplies L2792 $ 63,451,763 | $ 1,107,000 Premier
Alliance Construction and General
19 Supplies L2793 $ 77,246,138 | $ 1,455,750
Alliance Construction and General
19 Supplies L2794 $ 68,232,308 | $ 1,192,500
20 |DJ General Construction L2792 $ 71,162,500 | $ 1,107,000 Premier
20 |DJ General Construction L2793 $ 02925840 | $ 1,455,750
20 |DJ General Construction L2794 $ 87,074,452 | $ 1,192,500
Well Built Const Ser Lot 2792 $ 73,414515| % 1,192,500
21 | Well Built Const Ser Lot 2793 $ 05,504,482 $ 1,107,000 Caricom
Well Built Const Ser Lot 2794 $ 77,049,787 $ 1,455,750
SSAA Trucking Service & General
Contstruction Company Lot 2792 $ 722396001 $ 1,107,000
SSAA Trucking Service & General :
22 Contstruction Company Lot 2793 $ 1192500 Nafico
SSAA Trucking Service & General
Contstruction Company Lot 2794 $ 781320001 $ 1,192,500
F.M.C Const & Services Inc. Lot 2792 $ 65,884,560 | $ 088,268
23 | F.M.C Const & Services Inc. Lot 2793 $ 86,809,275 $ 1,111914 Premier
F.M.C Const & Services Inc. Lot 2794 $ 74127585 $ 1,302,139




Caribbean Solutions Lot 2792 $ 86,655450| $ 1,107,000

24 | Caribbean Solutions Lot 2793 $ 72,288,982 $ 1,455,750 Nafico
Caribbean Solutions Lot 2794 $ 70,849,842 $ 1,192,500
NK Enterrpise Lot 2792 $ 70,969,710| $ 1,107,000

25 | NK Enterrpise Lot 2793 $ 95897,130| $ 1,455,750 Caricom
NK Enterrpise Lot 2794 $ 75,462,240 % 1,192,500
Prestige Gen Supp & Contracting Lot $  71.941590| $ 1.107.000
2792

26 Zirggt'ge Gen Supp & Contracting Lot $  73024960|$ 1,455 750 Caricom
Prestige Gen Supp & Contracting Lot $ 74701200 $ 1192500
2794
Zameer Mohamed Gen Const Lot 2792 $ 59,772,720 $ 1,107,000

27 | Zameer Mohamed Gen Const Lot 2793 $ 74,762,100 $ 1,455,750 Nafico
Zameer Mohamed Gen Const Lot 2794 $ 61,529,685 $ 1,192,500
Probuild Const. Ser Lot 2792 $ 70,937,055($ 1,107,000

28 | Probuild Const. Ser Lot 2793 $ 04,178,963 | $ 1,455,750 Premier




Probuild Const. Ser Lot 2794 $ 77,965,598 $ 1,192,500
K& S Peetum Const Lot 2792 $ 71,321,565 $ 1,107,000
29 | K& S Peetum Const Lot 2793 $ 94,104,168 $ 1,455,750 Premier
K& S Peetum Const Lot 2794 $ 79,752,981 $ 1,192,500
Gladwyn Walcot Ralzamitz Renewal
Guyana Lot 2792 $ 04,893,120 $ 1,476,000
30 Gladwyn Walcot Ralzamitz Renewal $ 67358865 $ 1.941.000 Assuria
Guyana Lot 2793
Gladwyn Walcot Ralzamitz Renewal
Guyana Lot 2794 $ 81,057,930 $ 1,590,000
31 M. J(_)hnson Lawn Care and Maintenance $68.453 973 $1.107.000 Assuria
Service L2792
31 M. J(_)hnson Lawn Care and Maintenance $07.032.495 $1.455.750
Service L2793
31 M. J(_)hnson Lawn Care and Maintenance $75.504.398 $1.192.500
Service L2794
32 |Basdeo's Engineering Service L2792 $70,245,420 $1,107,000 Assuria
32 |Basdeo's Engineering Service L2793 $85,912,092 $1,455,750
32 |Basdeo's Engineering Service L2794 $70,421,610 $1,192,500
33 |Pantheon Construction Inc. L2792 $62,787,810 $1,107,000 Premier




33 [Pantheon Construction Inc. L2793 $84,170,193 $1,455,750
33 |Pantheon Construction Inc. L2794 $71,533,130 $1,192,500
34 Solo and Sons Construction Services $78.236,078 $1.680,000 Caricom
L2792
34 Solo and Sons Construction Services $96.450.000 $1.455.750
L2793
34 Solo and Sons Construction Services $72.034 515 $1.192.500
L2794
Premier (Form and
35 |KHE Engineering L2792 $ 1,107,000 | Tender Not Completed
& Signed)
35 |KHE Engineering L2793 $ 1,455,750
35 |KHE Engineering L2794 $ 1,192,500
Four Brothers Trucking & General :
36 Construction Service L2792 $79,544 545.50 $1,107,000 Nafico
Four Brothers Trucking & General
36 Construction Service L2793 $97,057,941.75 $1,192,500
Four Brothers Trucking & General
36 Construction Service L2794 $66,850,465.50 $1,455,750
37 [Chrome Construction L2792 $70,272,300 $1,107,000 Premier
37 [Chrome Construction L2793 $92,348,466 $1,455,750




37 [Chrome Construction L2794 $75,609,660 $1,192,500
38 |Z&H Investment Inc. L2792 $64,911,105 $1,022,050 Caricom
38 [Z&H Investment Inc. L2793 $95,963,963 $1,439,459
38 [Z&H Investment Inc. L2794 $74,366,040 $1,394,686
Alchemy Environmental and Chemical :
39 Analysis Consultancy L2792 $72,701,475 $1,107,000 Assuria
Alchemy Environmental and Chemical
39 Analysis Consultancy L2793 $97,024,032 $1.455,750
Alchemy Environmental and Chemical
39 Analysis Consultancy L2794 $79,235,478 $1,192,500
40 |GM Futuristic Development L2793 $80,440,500 $1,455,750 Caricom
40 |GM Futuristic Development L2794 $67,899,615 $1,192,500
Multiteach Engineering Services Inc. Lot $  69.992055|$  1.107.000
2792
41 Zh;lgétlteach Engineering Services Inc. Lot $  92813963| $ 1455750 Caricom
Multiteach Engineering Services Inc. Lot $  79800098|$ 1192500
2794
Nigel Construction Inc. Lot 2792 $ 81,304650| % 1,680,000
42 | Nigel Construction Inc. Lot 2793 $ 108,004,995 % 1,455,750 Caricom




Nigel Construction Inc. Lot 2794 $ 87,368,295| % 1,192,500
Panchu Dynamic Conracting Services Lot $  65963258|$ 1.107.000
2792

43 2P7a9n:;:hu Dynamic Conracting Services Lot $  89232623|$ 1455750 Premier
Panchu Dynamic Conracting Services Lot $  73606050|$ 1192500
2794
General Procurement & Construction Lot $ 88579.365| $§  1.107.000
2792

44 ZC;gr;eral Procurement & Construction Lot $ 119029.764| $  1.455 750 Premier
General Procurement & Construction Lot $ 101406974| $  1.192.500
2794
ZZ Construction Sercices Lot 2792 $ 68,598,390 $ 1,107,000

45 | ZZ Construction Sercices Lot 2793 $ 84,146,129 $ 1,455,750 Premier
ZZ Construction Sercices Lot 2794 $ 68,706,152 $ 1,192,500
Zeebo & Sons Const Lot 2792 $ 68,878,800 $ 1,107,000

46 | Zeebo & Sons Const Lot 2793 $ 70,439,545 $ 1,455,750 Premier
Zeebo & Sons Const Lot 2794 $ 74323830 $ 1,192,500




S. Jagmohan Const. & Gen Supplies Lot

9792 $ 73390,275| $ 1,800,000

47 Ziggngha” Const. & Gen Supplies Lot | o o5 ye5845| $ 1,800,000 Premier
S. Jagmohan Const. & Gen Supplies Lot $  83544930|$  1.800,000
2794
Zoom Contrating & Transport Ser Lot $ 71286390 $  1.107.000
2792

48 227%%”" Contrating & Transport SerLot | ¢ g1 375 960| § 1,455,750 Caricom
Zoom Contrating & Transport Ser Lot $ 75531503 $ 1192500
2794
S&S Engineering Lot 2792 $ 59,956,995(% 1,107,000

49 | S&S Engineering Lot 2793 $ 78,718,080| $ 1,455,750 Caricom
S&S Engineering Lot 2794 $ 64,636,005(3% 1,192,500
Copifix Lot 2792 $ 57,897,420.00| $ 1,476,000

50 [Copifix Lot 2793 $ 68,758,250.00| $ 1,941,000 Premier
Copifix Lot 2794 $ 67,904,760.00| $ 1,590,000
Klean Freakss Cleaning & Contracting $  73049550| $  1.107.000

Lot 2792




Klean Freakss Cleaning & Contracting

51 Lot 2793 $ 95807565 % 1,455,750 Caricom
Klean Freakss Cleaning & Contracting $  78244740|$  1.192.500
Lot 2794
Deo' Imperial Const. Inc Lot 2792 $ 71,245493| $ 1,680,000

52 | Deo' Imperial Const. Inc Lot 2793 $ 94242,348|$ 1,455,750 Caricom
Deo' Imperial Const. Inc Lot 2794 $ 76916,963| $ 1,192,500
Aronco Services Lot 2792 $ 87,246,440 $ 1,107,000

53 | Aronco Services Lot 2793 $ 129,280,463 | $ 1,455,750 Premier
Aronco Services Lot 2794 $ 120,546,374 $ 1,192,500
APEG Construction Inc Lot 2792 $ 79,811,025($ 1,107,000

54 | APEG Construction Inc Lot 2793 $ 100,780,155| $ 1,455,750 Premier
APEG Construction Inc Lot 2794 $ 79,219560( $ 1,192,500
E Cush Contracting Lot 2792 $ 715,037,930| $ 1,107,000

55 | E Cush Contracting Lot 2793 $ 87,798,165 $ 1,455,750 Citizen bank
E Cush Contracting Lot 2794 $ 72,411,124|% 1,192,500
Irvor Allen Lot 2792 $ 68,878,800 $ 1,107,000

56 | Irvor Allen Lot 2793 $ 70,439,545 $ 1,455,750 assuria
Irvor Allen Lot 2794 $ 74,323,830 $ 1,192,500




H&S Contracting Services Lot 2792 $ 60,468,450 $ 1,345,000
57 | H&S Contracting Services Lot 2793 $ 75,276,160 $ 1,071,000 Assuria
H&S Contracting Services Lot 2794 $ 72,336,075 $ 1,185,000
JR Civil Works Lot 2792 $ 66,733,695 % 1,107,000
58 | JR Civil Works Lot 2793 $ 89,916,277 $ 1,455,750 Caricom
JR Civil Works Lot 2794 $ 77673067 % 1,192,500
Bradleys Gen Merchandise Lot 2792 $ 83,615595| % 1,107,000
59 | Bradleys Gen Merchandise Lot 2793 $ 76,943,350 $ 1,455,750 Premier
Bradleys Gen Merchandise Lot 2794 $ 78,925508| % 1,192,500
Ceraturium Lot 2792 $ 5912,875| $ 1,476,000
60 | Ceraturium Lot 2793 $ 73,643,095| % 1,941,000 Caricom
Ceraturium Lot 2794 $ 70552545 % 1,590,000
61 |Caribee Civil Works Inc L2792 $ 68,858,750 |$ 1,107,000 Caricom
61 |[Caribee Civil Works Inc L2793 $ 87,778,215 |$ 1,455,750
61 |Caribee Civil Works Inc L2794 $ 72,313,395 [$ 1,192,500
62 |Tripple 'A' Establishment L2792 $ 68,043,832 [$ 1,680,000 Caricom
62 |Tripple 'A' Establishment L2793 $ 92,267,000 |$ 1,455,750
62 |Tripple 'A' Establishment L2794 $ 76,718,145 |$ 1,192,500




63 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2792 $ 64,138,987 |$ 1,107,000 Caricom v
63 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2793 $ 81,418575|$% 1,455,750
63 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2794 $ 64395250 |$ 1,192,500
A&O Mohammad's & Sons Construction )
64 & General Supplies L2792 $ 66,164,332 |$ 1,107,000 Caricom Ltr
A&O Mohammad's & Sons Construction
64 & General Supplies L2793 $ 80,520,930 | $ 1,455,750
A&O Mohammad's & Sons Construction
64 & General Supplies L2794 $ 65831,430 | $ 1,192,500
65 |[STP Investments Inc L2792 $ 69,785,730 | $ 1,046,786 Premier v
65 |STP Investments Inc L2793 $ 904 154,025 |$ 1,412,310
65 [STP Investments Inc L2794 $ 78,930,337 |$ 1,183,955
66 |Centaur Investments Inc L2792 $ 73,753,706 |$ 1,107,000 Premier v
66 |Centaur Investments Inc L2793 $ 05,364,465 |$ 1,455,750
66 |Centaur Investments Inc L2794 $ 79,061,535 |$ 1,192,500




67 |Jay's Construction & Logistics Services L21 $ 72,005,640 |$ 1,080,085 Assuria Ltr
67 |Jay's Construction & Logistics Services L27 $ 98,126,640 | $ 1,471,900
67 |Jay's Construction & Logistics Services L2191 $ 72,930,165 | $ 1,093,952
68 |M.K Enterprise L2792 $ 65161635 (% 1,107,000 Assuria v
68 |M.K Enterprise L2793 $ 80,174,693 |$ 1,455,750
68 |M.K Enterprise L2794 $ 60,195759 [$ 1,192,500
69 |Paramount Organization Inc L2792 $ 73,694,250 No Bid Security Seen X
69 [Paramount Organization Inc L2793 $ 94,685,745
69 |Paramount Organization Inc L2794 $ 78,109,754
70 [Dynamic Civil Works L2792 $ 1,680,000 Caricom v
70 [Dynamic Civil Works L2793 $ 92,346,765 | $ 1,455,750
70 |Dynamic Civil Works L2794 $ 75,787,792 | $ 1,192,500

Devcon Inc Lot 2792 $ 71,559,763 $ 1,107,000 v
71 | Devcon Inc Lot 2793 $ 71,147016|$ 1,455,750 Nafico

Devcon Inc Lot 2794 $ 76,339,626 $ 1,192,500

BM Property Inctments Inc Lot 2792 $ 87,959,970 % 1,319,400 v
72 | Deo' Imperial Const. Inc Lot 2793 $ 112,115971|$ 1,681,740 Caricom

Deo' Imperial Const. Inc Lot 2794 $ 79,023280| $ 1,455,349

Platium Investment Lot 2792 $ 68,202,624 $ 1,023,039 v




73 | Platium Investment Lot 2793 $ 90,506,745| $ 1,357,601 Premier
Platium Investment Lot 2794 $ 75795334| % 1,136,930
K&A Contracting Services Lot 2792 $ 71,089515| % 1,107,000
74 | K&A Contracting Services Lot 2793 $ 71,646,000 $ 1,455,750 Caricom
K&A Contracting Services Lot 2794 $ 71,786,610| $ 1,192,500
D&R Grace Business Ent Lot 2792 $ 64,148,280| $ 1,107,000
75 | D&R Grace Business Ent Lot 2793 $ 70,239,100| $ 1,455,750 Premier
D&R Grace Business Ent Lot 2794 $ 67,138425| % 1,192,500
Precision Integrated Construction &
Development Lot 2792 $ 66095988 % 991,440
Precision Integrated Construction & :
76 Development Lot 2793 $ 81801877|% 1,227,028 Premier
Precision Integrated Construction & $ 61916274 ¢ 928.744
Development Lot 2794 T ’
Permaul Trading & Distribution Lot 2792 | $ 85,697,430
77 | Permaul Trading & Distribution Lot 2793 | $ 117,932,430 $ 1,785,000 GTM
Permaul Trading & Distribution Lot 2794 | $ 87,895,815




A& Z Construction Lot 2792 $ 66,502,328| $ 1,107,000
78 | A& Z Construction Lot 2793 $ 83,989,931 % 1,455,750 Caricom
A& Z Construction Lot 2794 $ 68508,752| $ 1,192,500
EZE Way Construction Inc Lot 2792 $ 63,763,171| $ 1,022,050
79 | EZE Way Construction Inc Lot 2793 $ 72,979,075 $ 1,439,459 Caricom
EZE Way Construction Inc Lot 2794 $ 68,828,581
Zazsco Lot 2792 $ 67,270,830 $ 1,500,000
80 | Zazsco Lot 2793 $ 75,003,638 % 2,400,000 Caricom
Zazsco Lot 2794 $ 63531,279|$ 1,640,000
81 |[TopNotch Contracting Services L2792 $73,778,145 $1,680,000 Caricom
81 |[TopNotch Contracting Services L2793 $97,744,343 $1,455,750
81 |TopNotch Contracting Services L2794 $89,326,155 $1,192,500
82 |Phoenix Engineering & Consultant L2793 $73,754,625 $1,455,750 Premier
82 |Phoenix Engineering & Consultant L2794 $67,639,740 $1,192,500
83 |Money Tree Trading L2792 $65,442,300 $1,107,000 Premier
83 |Money Tree Trading L2793 $89,642,385 $1,455,750
83 |Money Tree Trading L2794 $77,202,300 $1,192,500




Yunas Civil & Building Construction

84 Services L2792 $68,879,895 $1,107,000 Caricom
84 Yungs Civil & Building Construction $84.513,629 $1.455,750
Services L2793
84 Yungs Civil & Building Construction $68.839,712 $1.192 500
Services L2794
85 Four Brothers Construction and Hradware $71.495.800 $1.107,000 Premier
Supply L2792
85 Four Brothers Construction and Hradware $91.810.845 $1.455.750
Supply L2793
85 Four Brothers Construction and Hradware $74.611.000 $1.192.500
Supply L2794
86 |Premium Asphalt L2792 $79,157,715 $1,187,366 Premier
86 [Premium Asphalt L2793 $123,791,850 $1,856,878
87 |Samaroo's Investment L2793 $125,285,400 $1,879,281 Premier
87 |Samaroo's Investment L2794 $107,381,240 $1,610,719
Caricom (Form of
88 [NR Enterprise L2793 $1,455,750|  Tender Page Not

Completed But Signed)

88

NR Enterprise L2794

$1,192,500




89 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L2792 $72,355,529 $1,107,000 Nafico
89 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L2793 $93,349,850 $1,455,750
89 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L2794 $74,463,015 $1,192,500
90 |(Eagle Eye Construction Company L2792 $85,829,310 $1,287,440 Premier
90 |Eagle Eye Construction Company L2793 $95,509,575 $1,432,644
90 |(Eagle Eye Construction Company L2794 $77,701,575 $1,165,524
R&P Engineering and General :
91 Construction L2792 73,422,300 | $ 1,107,000 Assuria
R&P Engineering and General
91 Construction L2793 95,282,565 | $ 1,455,750
R&P Engineering and General
o Construction L2794 77,719,140 $ 1,192,500
92 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services L2792 70,855,050 No Bid Security Seen




92 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services L2793 $ 96,242,790
92 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services L2794 $ 78,581,580
93 |GuyBiz Establishment L2792 $ 67930485 | $ 1,018,957 Assuria
93 |GuyBiz Establishment L2793 $ 86,233,623 | $ 1,113,678
93 |GuyBiz Establishment L2794 $ 74245227 | $ 1,293,504
94 E.E.(_:.S (Empire Electrical Contracting $ 60614925 | $ 909,224 Premier
Services) L2792
E.E.C.S (Empire Electrical Contracting
04 Services) L2793 $ 80,315,865 | $ 1,204,738
E.E.C.S (Empire Electrical Contracting
04 Services) L2794 $ 70,812,630 | $ 1,062,189
95 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. L2792 $ 60,213,405 | $ 1,680,000 Caricom
95 [Westbrook Caribbean Inc. L2793 $ 64918665 | $ 1,455,750
95 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. L2794 $ 55,195822 | $ 1,192,500
96 |Dundas Construction Inc. L2792 $ 72,839,288 | $ 1,107,000 Caricom
96 |Dundas Construction Inc. L2793 $ 92,612,520 | $ 1,455,750
96 |Dundas Construction Inc. L2794 $ 72,040,290 | $ 1,192,500
97 |Mobile Construction Company L2792 $ 71409555 | $ 1,071,144 Caricom




97 |Mobile Construction Company L2793 $ 95806830 $ 1,437,103
97 |Mobile Construction Company L2794 $ 74171580 | $ 1,112,574
Rahaman and Son's Construction and )
98 Maintenance Company L2792 $ 70,198,485 | $ 1,052,977 Caricom
Rahaman and Son's Construction and
%8 Maintenance Company L2793 $ 91,722,750 | $ 1375841
Rahaman and Son's Construction and
%8 Maintenance Company L2794 $ 72629925 % 1,134,448
Rahaman Construction and Transportation :
99 Services L2792 $ 66582915 $ 008,743 Caricom
Rahaman Construction and Transportation
99 Services L2793 $ 87,298,050 | $ 1,309,470
Rahaman Construction and Transportation
99 Services L2794 $ 69,964545 | $ 1,049,468
100 |Golden Bricks Construction L2792 $ 69,298,436 | $ 1,107,000 Caricom
100 |Golden Bricks Construction L2793 $ 90,853,552 | $ 1,455,757
100 |Golden Bricks Construction L2794 $ 74,661,452 | $ 1,192,500
101 |Avionics Engineering Inc. L2792 $65,354,625 $1,107,000 Nafico
101 [Avionics Engineering Inc. L2793 $86,099,790 $1,455,750
101 [Avionics Engineering Inc. L2794 $66,766,560 $1,192,500




102 |Bashier and Son's Construction Inc L2792 $83,208,457.50 $1,107,000 Caricom
102 |Bashier and Son's Construction Inc L2793 $73,646,107.50 $1,455,750
102 |Bashier and Son's Construction Inc L2794 $70,134,697.50 $1,192,500
103 |Kall Guy Inc. L2792 $70,881,265.80 $1,107,000 Caricom
103 |Kall Guy Inc. L2793 $94,746,233.40 $1,455,750
103 [Kall Guy Inc. L2794 $75,753,253.80 $1,192,500
104 RKCS (R. Kissoon Contracting Service) $99 171.975 $1.107,000 Premier
L2792
104 RKCS (R. Kissoon Contracting Service) $140.847 735 $1.455.750
L2793
104 RKCS (R. Kissoon Contracting Service) $120.435 315 $1.192.500
L2794
105 |Sawa Investment Inc. L2792 $72,261,210 $1,107,000 Premier
105 [Sawa Investment Inc. L2793 $96,499,557 $1,455,750
105 |Sawa Investment Inc. L2794 $72,978,360 $1,192.500
106 |Eclipse Construction L2792 $67,214,910 $1,007,250 Premier




107 |Dale Chowkai & Sons Construction L2792 $68,691,083 $1,107,000 Caricom v
107 |Dale Chowkai & Sons Construction L2793 $89,528,040 $1,455,750
107 |Dale Chowkai & Sons Construction L2794 $70,705,950 $1,192,500
108 K. Ramdial Construction & Services $65.781.450 $1.680,000 Caricom v
L2792
108 K. Ramdial Construction & Services $89 409 600 $1.455.750
L2793
108 K. Ramdial Construction & Services $70 162,785 $1.192.500
L2794
109 |Z & J Enterprise L2792 $72,774,555 $1,107,000 Premier Rec
109 |Z & J Enterprise L2793 $96,772,463 $1,455,750
109 |Z & J Enterprise L2794 $79,435,598 $1,192.500
110 |Royal Real Estate and Construction L2792 $72,787,785 $1,107,000 Premier v
110 |Royal Real Estate and Construction L2793 $96,542,116 $1,455,750
110 |Royal Real Estate and Construction L2794 $79,436,473 $1,192,500




Modern Construction & Trucking Services

111 L 2792 $66,791,760 $1,001,876 Assuria
111 Modern Construction & Trucking Services $93.950.760 $1.409.261

L2793
111 Modern Construction & Trucking Services $77.013.384 $1.155.201

L2794

Engineer's Estimate L2792 $ 73,800,000

Engineer's Estimate L2793 $ 97,500,000

Engineer's Estimate L2794 $ 79,500,000




