Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Office of the Prime Minister (394/2024/02) - Procurement of Security Services Public Affairs Department

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Accusafe Security Safe Service Inc. $ 25,370,928 | $ 507,419 Assuria v v v 2
2 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 29,420,263 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1
3 |Queensway Security Service Inc $ 70,464,038 |$ 1,410,000 Premier v v v 2
4  |Sheriff Security Inc. $ 26524152 |$ 1,049,639 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Castle Security Service Inc. $ 63,891,072 |% 1,300,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |LA Security Solutions Inc $ 44118546 | $ 882,370 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Strategic Action Security Limited $ 46,204,474 | $ 924,089 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Century 21 Security $ 46,774,656 | $ 935,493 Nafico v v v 2
9 |Applied Services $ 55,042,848 |$ 1,200,000 Premier v v v 2
10 [AtlasSecurity Services Inc. $ 20,509,056 | $ 820,362 Nafico v v v 2
11 |Hooseins Security Services Inc $ 43,644,864 | $ 995,102 Caricom v v v 2
12 [Amalgamated Security Service GuyanaIlnc| $ 27,362,736 | $ 547,255 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Nel Global Security Company Inc. $ 27,735,600 | $ 277,356 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Elite Protection Services Inc. $ 34581600 | % 788,460 Premier v v v 2
15 |NM Trucking Security Services $ 62,054,868 |$ 1,241,097 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (393/2024/02) - Engineering Procurement and Construction and Financing Services for Infrastructure Development Projects Phase 2

Lots 1-3
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & I?Alfniﬁi::rgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS IfFoernn(:Ieorf Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED
File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (411/2024/02) - Supply and Delivery of Safety Footwear
Bililzider Name of Bidder Bid Amount & i?niﬁi::rgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS I:Toernntzleorf Hard Fla}Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc L1 $18,375,000f $ 1,151,102| Hand in Hand v v v 2
1 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc L2 $31,387,500
1 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc L3 $7,792,600
1 |(Total $ 57,555,100
2 |Applied Services L1 $ 68,600,0000 $ 3,600,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Applied Services L2 $ 74,400,000
2 |Applied Services L3 $ 18,800,000
2 |Applied Services L4 $ 16,000,000
2 |Total $ 177,800,000




File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (413/2024/02) - Rehabilitation of Works to Internal Roads & Drains at GPL Compound Garden of Eden EBD

) . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency [ GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flgsh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |M&B Construction $ 141913640 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |PP Building Contracting $ 115,867,969 | $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Applied Services $ 100,745,150 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |BK International Inc $ 153,064,477 $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |K&S Peetum Construction $ 89,994,300 $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
6 g&ﬁ;’:}’;” Walcot Ralzamitz Renewal $ 89,817,915| $ 1,600,000  Assuria viv]| v 2
7 |KV Contracting Services $ 87,900,582 $ 1,600,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |S Manaram Enterprise $ 99,534,380 $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 91,851,540
File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (414/2024/02) - Supply Installation & Commissioning of 15 KV Class Metal Clad Switchgear Lot 1-4
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (264/2024/01) - Supply & Delivery of Electrical Items

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED
File Number: Guyana Lands and Surveys Commission (274/2024/01) - Supply of Light Detection and Randging (LIDAR) Survey for Region 1
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED
File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards (99/2024/23) - Servicing of GNBS Vehicles
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Alchemy Environmental & Chemical :
1 Y $ 4874000 BSD CompletedandSigned | Rec | v | 2
Analysis Consultancy
2 |Moto Trend Autospares and Repairs $ 7,540,480 BSD Completed and Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Demerara Harbour Bridge Corporation (193/2024/31) - Supply & Delivery of 10,000ft Marine Anchor Chain

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
No Bid Security Seen
1 |Quality Energy Guyana Inc. $ 45,109,800 (BSD Completed & X X v 2
Signed)
2 |Excel Guyana Inc. $ 29,898,009 $ 579,960 Premier v v v 1 2
3 |De Jonge Services & Investment $ 39,757,900 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
4 |Gopie Investments Inc. $ 37,750,374 $ 755,008 Premier v v v 2
5 |Doublefast Groupm Inc $ 36,782,900 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
6 |Electrofix Electrical Services $ 34,770,000 $ 700,000 REESEQSUBS nk v v v 2
7 |Alliance Investments $ 35,610,000 | $ 712,200 Premier v v v 2
8 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 37,753,000 | $ 755,060 GTM v v v 2
9 |[Toolsie Persaud Limited $ 27,863,880 | $ 850,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |S. Jagmohan Construction & Suppliesinc | $ 29,840,000 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |ASP Global $ 30,061,200 | $ 781,221 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (143/2024/39) - Procurement of Wheelchair for Difficult Circumstances Unit

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Archean $ 28,780,000| $ 575,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Pevot Enterprise $ 33,596,250 $ 671,925 Assuria v v v 1
3 |Alliance Investments $ 22.480,000| $ 449,600 Premier v v v 2
4 |Build Net $ 27,288,100| $ 478,740 Assuria v v v 2
5 |New GPC Inc $ 21,551,950| $ 450,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Global Health Care Supplies Inc $ 15,580,750 $ 311,615 RGBL v v v 2
7 ggﬁiﬁsezharmacy & General Constructing | 17516900l §  302,040|  Assuria v | v | v 2
8 |Meditron Inc $ 14,889,545| $ 297,791 Diamond v v v 2
9 |Western Scientific Company Ltd $ 18,823,577.40 $ 1,365,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Guyana School of Agriculture (464/2024/21) - Provision of Security Services from 1st February 2025 to 31st December 2025 Lots 1-3

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & a?nifﬁirgy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS IfFoernncqieorf Hard Fla.lSh

0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
No Bid Security Seen (Form
1 |D. Ton Security Services of Tender Page Not v v X 0
Completed & Signed)
2 |Amalgamated Security Service Guyana Inc| $ 45,438,120 $ 454,381 Assuria v v v 2
3 |LA Security Solutions Inc. $ 33,295752| $ 332,957 Nafico v v v 2
4 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 47,706,866 $ 500,000 Premier v v v 1
Premier (Form of Tender
5 |Applied Services $ 500,000| Page Not Completed But v v v 2
Signed)

6 |Int'l Security Services $  43,340,976| $ 866,820 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Elite Protection Services Inc. $ 54,688,536 | $ 546,885 Premier v v v 2
8 |Centaur Security Services Inc $ 43,512,085 | $ 435,121 Premier v v v 2
9 |Atlas Security Services Inc $ 33510431 (% 385,104 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (146/2024/45) - Provision of Security & Cash-In-Transit Services Lots 1-5

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |RK's Guyana Security Services L1 $ 436,029,562 $ 7,000,000 Premier v v v 1
1 |RK's Guyana Security Services L2 $ 129,338,399
1 |RK's Guyana Security Services L3 $ 45,793,253
1 |RK's Guyana Security Services L4 $ 50,361,233
1 |RK's Guyana Security Services L5 $ 11,469,540
2 |Elite Protection Services Inc. L1 $ 362,631,600 | $ 6,149,256 Premier v v v 2
2 |Elite Protection Services Inc. L2 $ 97,558,800
2 |Elite Protection Services Inc. L3 $ 31,860,000
2 |Elite Protection Services Inc. L4 $ 40,212,000
2 |Elite Protection Services Inc. L5 $ 7,146,000
3 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L1 $ 125,690,400 | $ 125,690 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L2 $ 101,263,800 |$% 1,012,638
3 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L3 $ 36,517,800 | $ 365,178
3 [Nel Global Security Company Inc L4 $ 40,029,000 | $ 400,290
3 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L5 $ 7,788,000 | $ 77,880
4 |Amalgamated Security Services Guyana | o 455 151 603 | $ 5323186 |  Assuria v v | v 2

Inc L1




Amalgamated Security Services Guyana

4 $ 108,268,998
Inc L2
4 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana $ 41,065,992
Inc L3
4 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana $ 43493280
Inc L4
4 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana $ 7.726.920
Inc LS
5 |[Strategic Action Security Limited L1 $ 29,580,537 | $ 1,003,048 Nafico
5 |Strategic Action Security Limited L2 $ 29,342,231
5 |Strategic Action Security Limited L3 $ 16,240,895
5 |Strategic Action Security Limited L4 $ 17,244,460
5 |Strategic Action Security Limited L5 $ 7,896,643
6 |Century 21 Security L1 $ 30,030,336 | $ 989,411 Nafico
6 |Century 21 Security L2 $ 29,785,920
6 |Century 21 Security L3 $ 16,580,160
6 |Century 21 Security L4 $ 17,532,288
6 |Century 21 Security L5 $ 8,021,952




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (465/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Agro-Chemicals for the Industry 2025 1st Crop Lots 1-6

Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender :
No. . Copy| drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED v v v
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (466/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of Low Grade Rock Phosphate (LGRP)
. Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. . Copy| drive
Currency signed
(Letter submitted
1 [Mijnmaatschappij Curacao BV $397,700.00 USD stating Bid Security | N/A | N/A v 1 0
wasn't processed)
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (467/2024/21) - Supply & Delivery of 600-1000 Litre 4WD Self Propelled Boom Sprayer
. Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI?Sh
No. . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Yellow Steel Inc $ 22,344,000| $ 472,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Health (439/2024/47) - Supply & Delivery of IT Hardware for PACS System CPTL-921-2024-P4

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Nextech Inc $ 19,440,000 | $ 400,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Meditron Inc $ 646,212,888 |$ 12,924,258 Diamond v v v 2
3 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 196,769,691 |$ 3,935,394 Assuria v v v 1
File Number: Ministry of Health (440/2024/47) - Extension & Rehabilitation of Leguan Cottage Hospital Region No.3
) . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency [ GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (79/2024/13) - Construction of Recycling Centre at Haag Bosch Sanitary Landfill

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 79377,322| $ 2,100,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Puran Bros Disposal Inc $ 210,870,570 $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 132,411,720 $ 200,000 GTM v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 170,401,791
File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (80/2024/13) - Construction of Hazardous Waste Cell at Haag Bosch Sanitary Landfill - Phase 1
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Puran Bros Disposal Inc $ 556,780,088 $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 385,837,935 $ 200,000 GTM v v v 2
3 |> Jagmohan Construction & General $ 372015525 $ 200,000  Premier Jvlv ]| v 2
Supplies Inc
4 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 324572115 $ 5,880,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 493,943,625




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1195/2024/40) - Construction of Houston Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 361,380,360 |$ 5,413,280 Caricom v v v 2
2 |STP Investments Inc $ 293,585,930 |$ 4,050,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |D. David International $ 375,171,720 |[$ 6,099,691 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 276,103,229 |$ 6,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 286,076,000 [$ 4,593,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 297,702,658 | $ 4,593,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Mobile Express $ 285918325 |$ 4,650,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |KNS General Contractors Inc $ 254,516,480 |$ 4,875,000 Caricom v v v 0
9 |Pantheon Construction Inc $ 308,000,000 [$ 4,500,000 Premier v v v 2

10 |MSR International Enterprise $ 379,340,720 |$ 6,113,976 Caricom v | V v 2
11 [PP Building Contracting $ 270,692,180 |$ 4,060,382 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1196/2024/40) - Designs & Construction Cost & Supervision Services for the Construction of Houston Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard| Flash
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive

1 Civil Engineering Lab Guyana (Financial Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1 5
Proposal Submitted) Page Completed & Signed

5 Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (Financial Bid Securing Declaration v v v 5
Proposal Submitted) Page Completed & Signed

3 GR Engineering Company (Financial Bid Securing Declaration v v v 5
Proposal Submitted) Page Completed & Signed

4 PME Consulting Engineers Inc (Financial Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1 0
Proposal Submitted) Page Completed & Signed
. i . Bid Securing Declaration

5 |CEC Inc (Financial Proposal Submitted) page Completed & Signed v v v 2
i i . . Bid Securing Declaration

6 |Siebtek Inc (Financial Proposal Submitted) page Completed & Signed v v v 1 0

7 Origin Investments (Financial Proposal Bid Securing Declaration v v v 0
Submitted) Page Completed & Signed

8 Innovative Engineering Consultancy Services Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1
(Financial Proposal Submitted) Page Completed & Signed

9 |Kalitech Inc (Financial Proposal Submitted) Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1 2

Page Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1185/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-St Stanislaus College

Bid Security

Form of

Biﬂder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,210,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 |V.B Elite Contracting $ 14,250,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |S.G All Electrical & Installation $ 13,442,820 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction & Services BSD C/S v v X 0
5 |T.L Drainage Disposal $ 14,200,000 BSD Not C But S v |letter v 0
6 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,480,000 v BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |Box Construction & Supplies $ 14,221,160 v BSD C/S v |letter v 1
8 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,570,000 v BSD C/S v v v 1
9 |Nicholas Bourn Contracting Services $ 12,980,000 v BSD C/S v |letter v 1

10 Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenace $ 7.140,000 v BSD C/S v v v 1

Services




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1186/2024/40) - Roof Rehabilitation of Kingston Secondary School

. Bid Security
Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form of Hard | Flash
0. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
1 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services FTP not gompleted Bid Securing Declgratlon Completed Y v Y 0
but signed and Signed
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,678,930 Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v 1
3 Shev_on s Drainage and General Maintenace $ 6.320.380 Bid Securing Decl_aratlon Completed Y v Y 1
Services and Signed
4 |The Property Experts Supplies Services $ 8,938,335| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
5 [PMW Construction & General Services $ 9,834,165| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v 1
6 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 7,950,580| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
7 |Vidrick Construction and Electrical Services | $ 9,730,160 Bid Securing Declaration Completed v v v 1

and Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1187/2024/40) - Roof Rehabilitation of St. John's College

. Bid Security

Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form of Hard | Flash

0. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
: . : Bi ing Declarati I
1 [J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,820,500 \d Securing &esci;rr]zgon Completed v v v 1
2 | Amazon Supply, Construction and Services FTP not gompleted Bid Securing Dec_laratlon Completed Y v Y 0
but signed & Signed

3 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 11,545,800 Bid Securing g(esczigtrrzgon Completed v v v 1
4 [T TS ERETE S SRS L g 8,662,500| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
5 |New Horizon Logistics $ 13,327,488 Bid Securing Declaration Not v v v 1
6 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,193,375 Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
7 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 11,429,250 Bid Securing Declaration Completed v v v 1

& Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1188/2024/40) - Roof Rehabilitation of Sophia PIC

. Bid Security
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form .Of Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
. . ) Bi ing Declarati I
1 [J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 13,152,825 \d Securing &esﬁgr:i;on Completed v v v 1
) ) Bi ing Declarati I
2 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services FTP not gompleted Id Securing ¢ aration Completed v v v 0
but signed & Signed
3 Sheyon s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 5298 615 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon Completed v v Y 1
Sevices & Signed
4 |New Horizon Logistics $ 13,012,338 Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
5 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 10,065,930 Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
6 |S.A.X Goodings Engineer $ 7,763,595| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1189/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility- Bishop High School

Bid Security

Bidder . . . . Form of Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency A(\:T?:fjenr:ci Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender signed | Copy| drive
Shevon's Drainage and General Maintenance
. $ 4,394,000 .. . .
Services Lot 1 Bid Securing Declaration Completed
1 , . . . v v v 1
Shevon's Drainage and General Maintenance & Signed
. $ 3,209,000
Services Lot 2
) PMW Construction & General Services Lot 1 $ 5,207,000| Bid Securing Declaration Completed J v J 1
PMW Construction & General Services Lot 2 $ 3,816,500 & Signed
3 Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services Lot 1 3 10,450,000| Bid Securing Declaration Completed Y v Y 1
Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 2,629,550 & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1190/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility- Cummingslodge Secondary School

. Bid Security
BlNdder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form_of Hard FI{fISh
0. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
Vidrick Construction and Electrical Services Lot $ 7290,000| . _ _
1 Bid Securing Declaration Completed
. Vidrick Construction and Electrical Services Lot & Signed v v v 1
) $ 6,760,000 J
) PMW Construction & General Services Lot 1 $ 11,190,000| Bid Securing Declaration Completed v v v 1
PMW Construction & General Services Lot 2 $ 9,482,000 & Signed
3 Innovative Sourcing Guyana Lot 1 $ 5,270,000 Bid Securing Declaration Completed Y v Y 1
Innovative Sourcing Guyana Lot 2 $ 6,701,000 & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1191/2024/40) - Painting and General Rehabilitation- St. Winefride's Secondary School

. Bid Security
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form_of Hard FI{fISh
No. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
) ) ) Bid Securing Declaration Completed
1 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies 3 12,825,600 g : P v v v 1
and Signed
i ) Bid Securing Declaration Completed
2 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 13,060,000 g P v v v 1

and Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1192/2024/40) - Painting and General Rehabilitation- New Central Secondary School

. Bid Security
Blsgler Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency ,Aénl](r)ren:cic Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Te:;erlzigfqe q 2;;3 ZE&Z
1 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 11,500,000 Bid Securing Decl_aranon Completed v v v 1
and Signed
2 |Box Construction and Supplies $ 12,806,638 Bid Securing Decl_a ration Completed v v v 1
and Signed
3 Shev_on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 7,940,000 Bid Securing Decl_aratlon Completed Y v Y 1
Services and Signed
. : Form of Tender Page Not| Bid Securing Declaration Completed
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services Completed but signed and Signed v v v 0
5 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 9,180,000| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1
6 |New Horizon Logistics $ 11,592,820( Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v 1
7 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,200,000( Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v 1
8 |Prime Services and Supplies $ 9,700,000| Bid Securing Declaration Completed | v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1193/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sport Facility - Tucville Secondary School

Bid Security

Bilglgler Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency AC\:nJ?IEJen:chL Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Te:;err”;i‘;';e g E'ggg ';'r"’l‘f;z
1 225\\/222'35 Drainage & General Maintenace $ 9,146,500 BSD C/S Y v v 1
2 |Aphrodite General Contractors $ 12,575,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana $ 12,575,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 17,188,640 BSD C/S v v v 1
5 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 21,749,000 BSD C/S v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1194/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sport Facility - Richard Ishmeal Secondary School

. Bid Security
Blﬂder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form.of Hard FI"’.ISh
0. Currency Tender signed | Copy | drive
1 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenace $ 9,146,500 BSD C/S v Y Y 1
Services
2 |Aphrodite General Contractors $ 12,575,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana $ 12,575,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 17,188,640 BSD C/S v v v 1
5 [PMW Construction & General Services $ 21,749,000 BSD C/S v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1199/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sport Facility - St. John's High School

. Bid Security
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Form.of Hard FI"’.ISh
No. Tender signed | Copy | drive
Currency
Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenace
1 . g $ 8,093,000 v v | v v 1
Services
2 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 12,477,500 v v v v 1

3 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 3,593,900 v v |letter v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1200/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-St. Roses High School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard | Flash
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
: : Bid Securing Declaration
1 [Box Construction & Supplies $ 14,113,486 Completed & Signed v | Ltr v 1
: : Bid Securing Declaration
2 |T.L Drainage Disposal $ 14,200,000 Not Completed & Signed v v v 0
. ) ) Bid Securing Declaration
3 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,790,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: : Bid Securing Declaration
4 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 13,400,000 Completed & Signed v Ltr v 1
5 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 7,140,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
6 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,210,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v Ltr v 1
Completed & Signed
7 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 12,980,000 Bid Securing Declaration v | Ltr v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1201/2024/40) - Rehabiliation of Sports Facility-Tutorial High School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard | Flash
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 7.291,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
: : Bid Securing Declaration
2 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana $ 7,381,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
3 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 11,760,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 7,129,000 Bid Securing Declaration v Ltr v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1202/2024/40) - Painting and General Rehabilitation - St. Johns College

Form of

Bi’iljgller Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Se@ﬂtzg?gount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS 'L'iegnndezr 2;;3 ZE&Z

1 |Prime Services and Supplies $ 12,700,000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v 1

Page Completed and signed
2 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services Not completed ut Bid Securing Declara_tlon X X v

signed Page Completed and signed

3 [Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 12,780,000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v 1
Page Completed and signed

4 |Box Construction and Supplies $ 14,442,116 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v 1
Page Completed and signed

5 Shev_on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 17.865.000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon Y Y Y 1
Services Page Completed and signed

6 |PMW Construction and General Services $ 13,140,000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v 1
Page Completed and signed

7 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,300,000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v 1
Page Completed and signed

8 |J. Hussain's Construction and Supplies $ 13,410,000 Bid Securing Declaration v v 1

Page Completed and signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1203/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-St. Winefride's Secondary School

Form of

Biﬁgler Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Se(g::_t'}ér'?‘cr;oum & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS ';egnn(i?jr 22;3 E:’?\S/:
. - Bid Securing Declaration
1 |New Horizon Logistics $ 12,923,820 page Completed and signed v v v 1
. . Signed not Bid Securing Declaration
2 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services completed Page Completed and signed v v v
3 |Prime Services and Supplies $ 12,680,000 Bid Securing Declaration | =, /|
Page Completed and signed
4 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 11,318,000 Bid Securing Declarapon v v v 1
Services Page Completed and signed
Bid Securing Declaration
5 [Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 12,956,000 Page not Completed norand | v v v 1
signed
6 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,456,000 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v v
Page Completed and signed
7 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,223,400 Bid Securing Declaration |, /|
Page Completed and signed
8 |BOX Construction and Supplies $ 13,888,350 Bid Securing Declara_tlon v v 1
Page Completed and signed
9 |Anya General Contracting Services $ 14,297,789 Bid Securing Declaration v | Rec 1

Page Completed and signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1204/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-North Georgetown Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bi’:ljder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
0. . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,480,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
: : Bid Securing Declaration
2 |Anya General Contracting Services $ 14,314,980 Completed & Signed v | Rec v 1
3 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 11,480,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
Form of Tender Page Bid Securing Declaration
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction & Services Not Completed But J : v v v 0
. Completed & Signed
Signed
. . Bid Securing Declaration
5 |New Horizon Logistics $ 14,892,820 Completed & Signed v v v 1
6 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 12,980,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v | Ltr v 1
Completed & Signed
7 |Box Construction & Supplies $ 14,135,000 Bid Securing Declaration v | Ltr v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1205/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-Cummings Lodge Secondary School

Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender .
No. . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 11,500,000 Bid Securing Dec_larat|on v v v 1
Completed & Signed
2 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 13,293,000 Bid Securing Dec_larat|on v v v 1
Completed & Signed
3 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,480,000 Bid Securing Dec_laranon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
Form of Tender Page Bid Securing Declaration
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction & Services Not Completed But g : v v v 0
: Completed & Signed
Signed
. : Bid Securing Declaration
5 |Anya General Contracting Services $ 14,314,980 Completed & Signed v | Rec v 1
6 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 7,140,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
: . . Bid Securing Declaration
7 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 13,980,000 Completed & Signed v | Ltr v 1
. . . Bid Securing Declaration
8 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 13,400,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: . Bid Securing Declaration
9 [New Horizon Logistics $ 14,062,820 Completed & Signed v v v 1
10 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,210,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
11 |Box Construction & Supplies $ 14,266,810 Bid Securing Declaration v | Ltr v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1206/2024/40) - Roof Rehabilitation of St. Barnabas High School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |PMW Construction and General Services 11,362,680 Bid securing declarqtlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
2 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services 11,499,180 Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
3 |New Horizon Logistics 13,732,188 Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
4 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance 9,083,970 Bid securing declara_tlon v J J 1
Services page completed and signed
5 |J. Hussain's Construction and Supplies 12,844,650 Bid securing declaration v v v 1

page completed and signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1207/2024/40) - Roof Rehabilitation of Agricola Practical Instruction Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |The Property Experts Supplies and Services $ 10,153,185 Bid securing declarqtlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
2 |Amazon Supply, Construction and Services Signed not Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 0
completed page completed and signed
3 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 7,420,300 Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 0
Services page completed and signed
4 |PMW Construction and General Services $ 1,171,710 Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
5 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 9,805,485 Bid securing declara_tlon v v v 1
page completed and signed
6 [J. Hussain's Construction and Supplies $ 12,972,120 Bid securing declaration v v v 1

page completed and signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1208/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility-Lodge Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
BlNdder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla_15h
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 [Superior General Services L1 7,970,000 Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed v v v 1
1 |Superior General Services L2 7,527,000 P 9
2 [Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L1 6,950,000 Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed v Lir v 1
2 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L2 6,364,850 P J
3 |Aphrodite General Contractors L1 7,270,000 Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed v Ltr v 1
3 |Aphrodite General Contractors L2 7,488,000 P g
Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenance
4 Services L1 6,424,000 Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1
Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenance Completed & Signed
4 : 7,881,500
Services L2
5 |P.M.W Construction & General Services L1 11,648,500 Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed v v v 1
5 |P.M.W Construction & General Services L2 14,266,000 P g
6 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L1 7,270,000 Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed v v v 1
6 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L2 7,488,000 P J




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1209/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility - North Georgetown Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Innovaive Sourcing Guyana L1 $ 4,598,400 Bid Securing Declaration
: v v v 0
Page Completed and signed
1 [Innovaive Sourcing Guyana L2 $ 7,538,000
: : : Bid Securing Declaration
2 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L1 $ 4,844,850 Page not Completed nor X X v 1
signed
2 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L2 $ 1,590,000 J
3 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 6,183,400 _ _ _
Services L1 Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1
, . . Page Completed and signed
Shevon's Drainage and General Maintenance
3 : $ 9,299,000
Services L2




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1210/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility-St.Joseph's High School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L1 $ 1,298,000 Bid Securing Declaration , , , .
1 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L2 $ 2,615,000 Completed & Signed
1 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L3 $ 7,388,000
2 |Aphrodite General Contractors L1 $ 1,298,000 Bid Securing Declaration , L , .
2 |Aphrodite General Contractors L2 $ 2,615,000 Completed & Signed
2 |Aphrodite General Contractors L3 $ 7,388,000
3 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 3,280,000

Services L1

Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenance Bid Securing Declaration
3 Services L2 3 8,110,000 Completed & Signed v v v .
3 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 9.289.000

Services L3
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L1 $ 6,940,000 Bid Securing Declaration
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L2 $ 7,350,000 Com Ieteg & Sianed v Ltr v 1
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L3 $ 7,845,000 P g
5 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L1 $ 2,030,000 : : :

. . . B Declarat

5 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L2 $ 4,795,000 Igf;a:;zg &eé:ia:]e;éon v v v 1
5 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L3 $ 7,250,500 P g




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1211/2024/40) - Roof Rehabiliation of Cummings Lodge Secondary School

Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender .
No. . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 13,657,600 Bid Securing Dec_larat|on v v v 1
Completed & Signed
2 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 12,549,955 Bid Securing Dec_larat|on v v v 1
Completed & Signed
: . Bid Securing Declaration
3 [New Horizon Logistics $ 13,925,680 Completed & Signed v v v 1
Form of Tender Page Bid Securing Declaration
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction & Services Not Completed But g : v v v 0
Signed Completed & Signed
5 Shev_on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 8 945,640 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
6 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 10,379,160 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
7 |Modern Urban Investments $ 14,210,000 Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1212/2024/40) - Painting & General Rehabiliation-South Ruimveldt Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS | Tender |Hard| Flash
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Cornerstone Construction $ 14,480,000 Bid Securing Dec!aratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
. . . Bid Securing Declaration
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,600,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
3 She\{on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 6,860,000 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Services Completed & Signed
Form of Tender
: : Page Not Bid Securing Declaration
4 |Amazon Supply, Construction & Services Completed But Completed & Signed v v v 0
Signed
. - Bid Securing Declaration
5 [New Horizon Logistics $ 13,662,820 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: i . Bid Securing Declaration
6 |Prime Services & Supplies $ 12,650,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
7 [Modern Urban Investments $ 14,210,000 Bid Securing Declaration |, 1, |, 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1213/2024/40) - Painting and General Rehabilitaiton-St Barnabas Special School

. . Bid Security Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh

0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Box Construction and Supplies $ 14,723,108 BSD C/S v | letter v 1
2 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 15,718,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Modern Urban Investment 3 14,254,800 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services 3 7,196,400 BSD C/S v |letter| V 1
5 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 14.871.160 BSD C/S v v v 1
Services

6 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 10,190,460 BSD C/S v |letter v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1215/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility-St. Stanislaus College

. . Bid Security Form of

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh

0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,026,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
5 Shev_on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 9,119,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
Services

3 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 14,378,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 6,268,000 BSD C/S v |letter v 1
5 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana 3 7,808,600 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 |Aphrodite General Construction $ 7,808,000 BSD C/S v |letter v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1217/2024/40) - Painting and General Rehabiltation- Dolphin Secondary School

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Ii?niﬁ?ilgy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Ifl'c:a;rzeorf Hard Fla}sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 Shev_on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 7.140,000 BSD C/S v v v 1

Services
2 |T.L Drainage Disposal $ 14,200,000 BSD Not C/S v |Letter] 0
3 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services $ 12,980,000 BSD C/S v |Letter v 1
4 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,350,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
5 |Superior General Services $ 14,900,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 |Prime Services And Supplies $ 13,050,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |New Horizon Logistics $ 14,742,820 BSD C/S v v v 1
8 |Modern Urban Investment $ 14,210,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
9 |Box Construction and Supplies $ 14,332,712 BSD C/S v |Letter v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1219/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sports Facility-Dolphin Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana $ 7,688,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 14,678,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 She\{on s Drainage and General Maintenance $ 9,289,000 BSD C/S v v v 1

Services

4 |Aphrodite General Construction $ 7,688,000 BSD C/S v | letter v 1
5 |Prime Services And Supplies $ 7,479,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 [Modern Urban Investment $ 14,246,000 BSD C/S v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1220/2024/40) - Roof Rehabiliation of St. Winefride's Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 She\{on s Drainage & General Maintenance 9,553,930 Bid Securing Dec_laratlon Y v Y 1
Services Completed & Signed
2 |P.M.W Construction & General Services 12,548,550 Bid Securing Dec!aratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
: . Bid Securing Declaration
3 |New Horizon Logistics 13,606,275 Completed & Signed v v v 1
4 |Modern Urban Investments 14,147,700 Bid Securing Dec!aratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
5 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services 13,440,000 Bid Securing Declaration v v v 1

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1222/2024/40) - Rehabiliation of Sport Facility - Freeburg Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of

Bllsder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh

0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 [Nicholas Bourn Contracting Services $ 6,255,750 BSD C/S v |letter v 1
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 12,049,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana $ 7,920,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 She\{on s Drainage & General Maintenace $ 9,878,000 BSD C/S v Y Y 1
Services

5 |PMW Const & Gen Serv $ 14,200,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 |Aphrodite Gen Contractors $ 7,920,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |Prime Services & Supplies $ 7,478,920 BSD C/S v |letter v 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1223/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Sport Facility-North Rumiveldt Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Aphrodite General Construction Lot 1
1 |(VAT) $ 5670000 BSD C/S v lletter] v 1
Aphrodite General Construction Lot 2 $ 7,161,000
Vsintenae Saviees Lot 1 - 5 12720000
2 , - BSD C/S v v v 1
Shevon's Drainage and General $ 7 601.000
Maintenance Services Lot 2 o
EMW Construction & General Services Lot $ 14,346,000
3 : . BSD C/S v v v 1
;MW Construction & General Services Lot $ 10,100,000
Innovative Sourcing Guyana Lot 1 $ 5,150,000
4 Innovative Sourcing Guyana Lot 2 $ 7,161,000 BSD C/S v v v L
5 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services Lot1| $ 17,222,400 BSD C/S v |Letter] 1




Date of Tender Opening: December 17, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (1224/2024/40) - Rehabiliation of Sports Facility-East Ruimveldt Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 She\{on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 5,663,400

Services L1

Shevon's Drainage & General Maintenance Bid Securing Declaration
L Services L2 3 9,190,000 Completed & Signed v v v L
1 She\{on s Drainage & General Maintenance $ 9.249.000

Services L3
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L1 $ 4,446,000 Bid Securing Declaration , , , .
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L2 $ 3,410,000 Completed & Signed
2 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L3 $ 5,740,000
3 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L1 $ 4,814,500 Bid Securing Declaration
3 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L2 $ 5,780,630 Com Ieteg & Sianed v v v 1
3 |Nicholas Bourne Contracting Services L3 $ 6,342,000 P g
4 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L1 $ 4,368,000 : : :
4 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L2 $ 2,850,000 Blgosnia:élgg zeé::ag[éon v v v 1
4 |Innovative Sourcing Guyana L3 $ 7,388,000 P J
5 |Aphrodite General Contractors L1 $ 4,368,000 : : :

. — B Declarat

5 |Aphrodite General Contractors L2 $ 2,850,000 IgosniCLII:tgg &egia;a;éon v v v 1
5 |Aphrodite General Contractors L3 $ 7,388,000 P g




6 |P.M.W Construction & General Service L1 $ 5,775,000
6 |P.M.W Construction & General Service L2 $ 7,113,500
6 |P.M.W Construction & General Service L3 $ 11,480,000

Bid Securing Declaration
Completed & Signed




